AGENDA
JACKSON CITY COUNCIL MEETING
June 1, 2021 - 9:00 A.M

George A Smith Meeting Room

l. CALL TO ORDER.
Il. INVOCATION AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE FLAG.
Ross Priddy
. ROLL CALL
IV.  APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF THE May 4, 2021 CITY COUNCIL MEETING
V. PROCLAMATIONS/RECOGNITIONS
VI.  INVITATION FOR PUBLIC COMMENT
VIl. FIRST READING
1. Consideration of an ordinance to rezone property located at the Southwest
quadrant of Highway 70 East, Interstate 40 and Ridgecrest Road Extended from
A-O (Agriculture/Open Land) District to SC-1 (Planned Unit Commercial
Development) District, comprising 68.7 acres, more or less.
2. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - Insurance Recovery Municipal
Maintenance $13,083.68
3. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - Insurance Recovery EDP
Equipment $11,689.09
4. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - Insurance Recovery for The

Ballpark at Jackson $35,628.72



5. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - JPD Grant $79,538.00

6. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - JPD Grant $36,448.00

7. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - Urban Transportation Planning
Grant $17,494.00

8. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - Capital Outlay Fund
$1,061,431.00

9. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - Proposed Employee Bonus
$410,992.88

10. Consideration of a proposed budget ordinance for FY 2022

11.Consideration of an ordinance to amend Building Codes 2018 International Codes

12.Consideration of an ordinance to amend Fire Codes 2018 International Codes

Vill. SECOND READING

1. Consideration of a proposed budget amendment - EMA Tornado Warning Siren
$13,469.00
NEW BUSINESS
1. Consideration of a resolution — Urban Transportation Planning Grant
2. Consideration of the adoption of the City of Jackson Pension Plan Funding Policy
3. Consideration of contract CMA 2272 between the State of Tennessee, Department

of Transportation, and the City of Jackson

4. Consideration of contract CMA 2273 between the State of Tennessee, Department

of Transportation, and the City of Jackson
5. Consideration of Board Appointments:

a. JEA Board — consideration of reappointment of Dr. Logan Hampton



b. West Tennessee Healthcare Board — consideration of reappointment of Phil
Bryant
c. Keep Jackson Beautiful Board — consideration of appointment of Rachel
Guyer to replace Keith Davis, Jenni Deming to replace Richard Donnell, and
Abensiba Misiedjan to replace Anne Vanderlinde
6. Consideration of budget amendments less than $10,000.00
7. Consideration of Invoices over $10,000.00

X. ADJOURN.



City of

e i st i e e
Stan Pilunt . ™ Telephone: 731-425-8286
111 E. Main St, Connect Here Fax: 731-425-8281
Suite 201 = Email: spilant@cityofjackson.net

Jackson, Tennessee 38301

PLANNING DEPARTMENT

MEMORANDUM

TO: Mayor Scott Conger

FROM: Brittany Alexander, Planning Coordinator

SUBJECT: Planning Related Council Agenda Item for June 1, 2021
DATE: May 19, 2021

Please place the following planning related council agenda item under First Reading
on the June, 2021 City Council Agenda:

1. Consideration of an Ordinance to rezone property located at the Southwest
quadrant of Highway 70 East, Interstate 40 and Ridgecrest Road Extended from
A-O (Agriculture/Open Land) District to SC-1 (Planned Unit Commercial
Development) District, comprising 68.7 acres, more or less.

Attached, for your review, is all the information relative to the First Reading agenda
item.

Scott Conger, Mayor



MEMORANDUM

TO:  Jackson City Council
FROM: Planning Staff

RE: Rezone S.W. Quadrant of Hwy 70 E, Interstate 40 and Ridgecrest Rd
Extended

DATE: May 19, 2021

The Jackson Municipal Regional Planning Commission met on Wednesday, May 5,
2021, and unanimously recommended approval of a request to rezone property
located at the Southwest quadrant of Highway 70 East, Interstate 40 and
Ridgecrest Road Extended from A-O (Agriculture/Open Land) District to SC-1
(Planned Unit Commercial Development) District, comprising 68.7 acres, more or
less.

The Planning Staff recommends approval since it represents a logical extension
of the surrounding SC-1 (Planned Unit Commercial Development) District and is
compliance with the Comprehensive Civic Master Land Use Plan.

Attached for your consideration and review is all information relative to this
request.



S
e
T

7 ¥
i T 4
T T A A

TVIOHINWOD AINNV1d) L1-0S :0L NIdO/IVHNLINJIHDY) OV :INOH
"dLlX3 a4 1S3HOIADAIY ® 0 ILV.LSHILNI LSV 0L AVMHDIH 40 LNVHAVNO "M’'S
VIHVY H3D4V1 A3ANININODDTY 44VLS - dVIN NOILYDOT 3 LIS HDNINOZ3H




ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE OFFICIAL MAP OF THE
CITY OF JACKSON

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF JACKSON:

SECTION 1. The Official Zoning Ordinance of the City of Jackson and the Zoning Map, which is a part
thereof, is hereby amended by changing rezone property located at the Southwest quadrant of Highway 70
East, Interstate 40 and Ridgecrest Road Extended from A-O (Agriculture/Open Land) District to SC-1 (Planned
Unit Commercial Development) District, comprising 68.7 acres, more or less, more fully described as follows:

Beginning at a point on the south margin of Interstate 40 and the northwest corner of the JAP
Family Limited Partnership tract (Madison County Tax Map 42, Parcel 66.00) as recorded in
Deed Book 577, Page 586; thence east along the south margin of Interstate 40, 2,240 +/- feet
to the northwest corner of a JEA utility easement; thence southwest, 80 feet to the southwest
corner of said easement; thence southwest parallel and 450 feet from the centerline of U. S.
Highway 70 East a distance of 1,687 +/- feet to a point on the north margin of Ridgecrest Road
Extended; thence continuing southwest a distance of 915 feet to a point on the south line of
the south tract of the JAP Family Limited Partnership tract; thence west along the south line,
665 +/- feet to a point at the southwest corner of the south tract of the JAP Family Limited
Partnership tract; thence north along the west line of JAP Family Limited Partnership tract,
crossing Ridgecrest Road Extended, a distance of 2,080 +/- feet to the point of beginning and
containing 68.7 +/- acres.

SECTION 2. This Ordinance becomes effective from and after its adoption, the public welfare
requiring it.

INTRODUCED 1% READING:

ADOPTED 2" READING:

MAYOR



CITY OF JACKSON
ZONING REPORT

APPLICANT Agent: Chris W. Alexander (HCB Development)
OWNER JAP Family Ltd Partners
ADDRESS 605 South Royal Street
Jackson, TN 38301
LOCATION Property:  Southwest quadrant of U.S. Highway 70
& Interstate 40
ACERAGE Requested: 68.7 +/- acres (Staff recommended larger area)
TAX MAP REFERENCE Map 42 Parcel 66.00
PRESENT USE Vacant Open Agriculture Land
PROPOSED USE TAG Truck Center Sales/Service
(90,000 square feet)
PRESENT ZONING A-O (Agriculture/Open Land) District
PROPOSED ZONING SC-1 (Planned Unit Commerclal Development) District
OCA

The property Is located in the southwest quadrant of Interstate 40, U. S. Highway 70 East @ Ridgecrest Road Extended.
CURRENT LAND USE

The property is generally bounded on the north by the Interstate, on the east by vacant open land, commercial & a single family
resldentlal home, on the south by vacant open agriculture land and on the west by vacant open agriculture land.

UTILITIES

JEA electric, water, gas & sewer can be made available to the site via JEA policies and procedures.
PETITIONER’'S JUSTIFICATION

See attached Statement of Justification,

LAND USE PLAN

This property is currently depicted within the Comprehensive Civic Master Land Use Plan as an area deemed appropriate for Corridor
Commercial; therefore, an amendment to the Comprehensive Civic Master Land Use Plan is not necessary.

REZO STAFF RECOM DATION

The Planning Staff recommends approval since it represents a logical extension of the surrounding SC-1 (Planned Unit Commercial
Development) District and is compliance with the Comprehensive Civic Master Land Use Plan,

Madison County, Tennessee Zoning Report Page 1 of 1



Rezoning Application

Statement of Justification

Date: April 1%, 2021
Property Owner: JAP Family Limited Partnership
Location of Property to be Rezoned:

Hwy 70 East 2049, Jackson TN 38305 — Portion of Tract 1 — Approximately 40
Acres

JAP Family Limited Partnership has under contract the sale of land described
above and noted on the attached survey to TAG Real Estate Holdings, LLC. The
applicant is requesting reclassification from the Agricultural (A-O) district to

Commercial (SC-1) district.

The buyer is an entity of TAG Truck Center which is currently located at 112

E.L. Morgan Drive, Jackson TN 38305, www.tntxtruck.com TAG is looking to
expand its current operations and relocate to this property where it can bﬁild
a larger facility and have good visibility from Interstate 40. The plans are for
an approximately 90,000 square foot TAG Truck Center that will offer truck
and trailer sales along with a parts and service department, The investment in

this facility could be approximately $12 million.




CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #: 45
FY21 Budget Amendment
SUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS
MAYOR APPROVAL DATE;:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:
APPROVED BUDGET  TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FrY21 BUDGET
GENERAL REVENUE
{nsurance/Personal Recoveries 110-36350 252,700.00 - 252,700.00
TOTAL REVENUE 252,700.00 - 252,700.00
[exPenDITURE APPROVED BUDGET  TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
POLICE
Recoverable Damages 110-44720-390 - 13,083.68 13,083.68
TOTAL EXPENDITURE - 13,083.68 13,083.68
NOTES Insurance claim for Maintenance 1997 Ford 250.
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:
AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:
Created Date: 4/26/2021 By: Cathy Keck

4/27/2021 3:53 PM
!



CiTY OF JACKSON Amendment #; 46
FY21 Budget Amendment
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS
MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:
APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED

Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
GENERAL REVENUE

Insurance/Persanal Recoveries 110-36350 252,700.00 - 252,700.00
TOTAL REVENUE 252,700.00 - 252,700.00
EXPENDITURE APPROVED  BUDGET  TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT Fy21 BUDGET
EDP Equipment

Recoverable Damages - Informat System (IS) 110-41640-390 - 1,500.99 1,500.99
Recoverable Damages - Pringle Park 110-44500-390 - 2,368.10 2,368.10
lRepair and Maintenance - Traffic Signals 110-43590-330 3,946.56 7,820.00 11,766.56
TOTAL EXPENDITURE 3,946.56 11,689.05 15,635.65
NOTES Insurance claim for Lightning damage to EDP Equipment 3/27/21.
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:

AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:

Created Date: revised 5/13/21 By: Cathy Keck

5/13/2021 10:53 AM
<



CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #; 52
FY21 Budget Amendment
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS
MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:
APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
GENERAL REVENUE
Insurance/Pessonal Recoveries 110-36350 252,700.00 - 252,700.00
TOTAL REVENUE 252,700.00 - 252,700.00
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description Fy21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
BALL PARK
Recoverable Damages -Pringles 110-44500-3%0 35,628.72 35,628.72
TOTAL EXPENDITURE 35,628.72 35,628.72
NOTES Insurance claim for Balipark
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:
AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:
Created Date: 5/20/2021 By Cathy Keck

5/20/2021 10:32 Al\fl3



MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:

COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:

CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #: 50
FY21 Budget Amendment
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS

APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR GRANT
CESF - JAG 315-33491 - 79,538.00 79,538.00
TOTAL GRANT REVENUE - __79,538.00 79,538.00
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR GRANT
ICESF -JAG 315-42106-900 - 79,538.00 79,538.00
TOTAL GRANT EXPENDITURE - 79,538.00 79,538.00
NOTES Faderal CESF JAG grant for capital purchase of Ballistics Comparison Microscope.
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:

AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:

Created Date: 4/27/2021 By: Cathy Keck



CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #: 51
FY21 Budget Amendment
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS
MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:
APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR GRANT
PSN Grant 110-33189 - 36,448.00 36,448.00
TOTAL GRANT REVENUE - 36,448.00 36,448.00
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR GRANT )
IPSN GRANT 110-42199-250 - 36,448.00 36,448.00
TOTAL GRANT EXPENDITURE - 36,448.00 36,448.00

NOTES

AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:

AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:

Federal PSN grant for anti-gun crime media campaign.

Created Date:

4/27/2021 By:

Cathy Keck




CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #; 53
FY21 Budget Amendment
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS

MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:

APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR GRANT
TOTAL GRANT REVENUE - - -
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description Fy21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR GRANT
UTPG Grant 110-41711-290 - 17,494.00 17,494.00
Co Trustee/Clerk Commission 110-41900-591 - (17,494.00) (17,494.00)
TOTAL GRANT EXPENDITURE - - -
NOTES 10 percent local funding match for Urban Transportation Planning Grant.

AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:

AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:

Created Date: §/20/2021 By: Cathy Keck




CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #: 54
FY21 Budget Amendment Updated
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS
MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:
APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR STREET RESURFACING
ITransfer from Fund Batlance 315-37900 - 1,049,878.00 1,049,878.00
TOTAL GRANT REVENUE - 1,049,878.00 1,049,878.00
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR STREET RESURFACING
IFire Dept Buildings 315-42254-900 33,970.00 (702.00) 33,268.00
Mayor's Office 315-41310-900 - 31,658.00 3%,658.00
Street Resurfacing 315-43190-931 1,506,446.00  1,807,377.00 3,313,823.00
Groundskeeping 315-44730-900 19,000.00 10,412.00 29,412.00
Municipal Court Building 315-41815-900 895,622.00 {617,594.00) 278,028.00
Fire Dept Operations 315-42220-900 5,629,502.00 {32,525.00) 5,596,977.00
Animal Care 315-41903-900 584,493.00 {123,154.00) 461,339.00
Street Maintenance 315-43190-900 140,615.00 {475.00) 140,140.00
Ishirlene Mercer Park 315-44540-900 57,994.00 {13,566.00) 44,428.00
TOTAL GRANT EXPENDITURE 8,867,642.00 1,061,431.00 9,929,073.00
Budget Amendment for Street Resurfacing FY20 - FY21 project. Balance of
$11,553 expense will be covered by unbudget Revenue in Interest Earned
NOTES {53,866}, Prior Year Taxes ($7,656), and Prior Year Tax Equivalent ($31).
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:

AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:

Created Date: 5/20/2021 By: Cathy Keck



CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #: 55
FY21 Budget Amendment Updated
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS
MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE:
APPROVED BUDGET TOTALAMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR EMPLOYEE BONUS
TOTAL REVENUE - - -
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FYz1 BUDGET AMENDMENT Y21 BUDGET
AMEND FOR EMPLOYEE BONUS
Employee Bonus - Salary 328,200.00 328,200.00
Employee Bonus - Benefits 82,792.88 82,792.88
TOTAL EXPENDITURE - 410,992.88 41(,992.88
NOTES Recommended employee bonus
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:
AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:
Created Date: 5/20/2021 By: Cathy Keck




AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE
OFFICIAL CODE OF THE CITY OF JACKSON
RELATIVE TO TITLE 12 BUILDING, UTILITY, ETC. CODES,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF JACKSON THE FOLLOWING:

SECTION 1. That the text of the Official Code of the City of Jackson, Title 12
BUILDING, UTILITY, ETC. CODES, CHAPTERS 2 - 8 and CHAPTERS 10 - 12, be deleted in

its entirety and replaced with the following:

SECTION

CHAPTER 2

BUILDING CODE

12-201. Adopted.
12-202. Fees

SECTION

12-201. Adopted. Pursuant to authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated, section
6-54-502, et seq., and for the purpose of regulating the construction, alteration, repair, and
demolition of every building or structure, or any appurtenance connected or attached to any
building or structure, the 2018 edition of the International Building Code (Fourth Printing), as
prepared and adopted by the International Code Council International, Inc., exciuding all
appendices thereto, and containing certain modifications, is hereby adopted and incorporated
by reference as a part of this code of ordinances.

12-202. Fees. All fees shall be set forth in a schedule of fees as authorized and approved
from time to time by resolution of the City Council.

CHAPTER 3

ELECTRICAL CODE

12-301. Adopted.
12-302. Low voltage permit required.

12-301. Adopted. Pursuant to authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated, section
6-54-502, et seq., and for the purpose of regulating the construction, alteration, repair, and
demolition of every building or structure, or any appurtenance connected or attached to any
building or structure, the 2017 edition of the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), of the
National Fire Protection Association, excluding all appendices thereto, and containing certain
modifications, is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as a part of this code of
ordinances.




12-302. Low voltage permit required. A low voltage permit, which shall include
phone, cable, data, with the exception of fire alarm wiring, shall be henceforth required for
any new residential and/or commercial construction. All such permits shall be issued at the
cost of twenty-five dollars ($25.00) when the project is less than twenty-five thousand dollars
($25,000). When the project is twenty-five thousand dollars ($25,000) or greater, the permit
shall be issued at a cost of one hundred doflars ($100.00).

CHAPTER 4
GAS CODE

SECTION
12-401. Adopted.

12-401. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502 et seq., the 2018 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code (Third Printing),
excluding all appendices thereto, as prepared and adopted by the International Code Council
International, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and incorporated in this code of
ordinances.

CHAPTER 5

PLUMBING CODE

SECTION
12-501. Adopted.

12-501. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502 et seq., the 2018 edition of the International Plumbing Code (Third
Printing), excluding all appendices thereto, as prepared and adopted by the International Code
Congress International, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and incorporated in this code of
ordinances.

CHAPTER 6

MECHANICAL CODE

SECTION
12-601. Adopted.

12-601. Adopted. Pursuant to authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated, section
6-54-502 et seq., the 2018 edition of the [nternational Mechanical Code (Third Printing),
excluding all appendices thereto, as prepared and adopted by the International Code Council
International, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and incorporated in this code of
ordinances.




CHAPTER 7

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

SECTION
12-801. Adopted

12-801. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502, et seq., the 2018 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code
(Second Printing), excluding all appendices thereto, as prepared and adopted by the
International Code Council International, Inc., and containing certain modifications, is hereby
adopted and incorporated by reference as a part of this code of ordinances.

CHAPTER 8

ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

SECTION
12-1001. Adopted.

12-1001. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502, et seq., the 2012 edition of the International Energy Conservation Code
(Second Printing), excluding all appendices thereto, as prepared an adopted by the
International Code Council International, Inc., and containing certain modifications, is hereby
adopted and incorporated by reference in this code of ordinances.

CHAPTER 10

RESIDENTIAL CODE
FOR ONE-AND-TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS

SECTION
12-1101. Adopted.

12-1101. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502, et seq., the 2018 edition of the International Residential Code (Third
Printing), including appendices E (Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings), J (Existing
Buildings and Structures), M (Home Daycare-R3 Occupancy), Q (Tiny Houses), excluding
all other appendices thereto, as prepared an adopted by the International Code Council
International, Inc., and containing certain modifications, is hereby adopted and incorporated
by reference in this code of ordinances.




CHAPTER 11

ACCESSIBILITY CODE

SECTION
12-1201. Adopted.

12-1201. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502, et seq., Tennessee Code Annotated, the 2009 edition of ICC/ANSI A117.1
Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities (First Printing), is hereby adopted and
incorporated by reference in this code of ordinances.

CHAPTER 12

Existing Building Code

SECTION
12-1301. Adopted.

12-1301. Adopted. Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated,
section 6-54-502 et seq., the 2018 edition of the International Existing Building Code (Fourth
Printing), excluding all appendices thereto, as prepared and adopted by the International Code
Congress International, Inc., is hereby adopted by reference and incorporated in this code of
ordinances.

SECTION 2. That Exhibit A, attached to this ordinance, represents all modifications
contained in the aforementioned codes being adopted and incorporated by reference in the
Official Code of the City of Jackson by the passage of this ordinance.

SECTION 3. That this ordinance becomes effective on January 1, 2022, the public
welfare requiring it.

MAYOR

INTRODUCED:

ADOPTED:




FEE CHANGES 2021

NOTE: PERMIT FEES HAVE NOT BEEN INCREASED SINCE CODE
ADOPTION IN 2005



CURRENT FEES

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING PERMITS/FEES
Residential Building Permits are required for all construction, alteration or repairs, fences, accessory
buildings, etc. when the total value is $100.00 (one hundred dollars) or more.

FEES FOR NEW RESIDENTIAL

LESS THAN 1000 SQ. FT. MIN. FEE $140.00

1000 SQ. FT. TO 2000 SQ. FT. $150.00 PLUS $.18 PER SQ. FT.
OVER 1000 SQ. FT.

2001 SQ. FT. TO 3000 SQ. FT. $275.00 PLUS $.20 PER SQ. FT.
OVER 2000 SQ. FT.

MORE THAN 3000 SQ. FT. $450.00 PLUS $.22 PER SQ. FT.
OVER 3000 SQ. FT.

ADDITIONS/ALTERATIONS $4.00 PER THOUSAND WITH A
MINIMUM FEE OF $20.00

The above fees shall be based on square feet of heated areas (all levels) plus one-third of the square feet
of unheated areas and areas under roof calculated as follows:

(A) Heated areas are measured along outside of exterior walls.

(B)  Unheated areas and areas under roof such as garages, unfinished basements, carports,
covered patios, etc. shall be measured along their outside walls of supports.




DEVELOPMENT PERMITS/FEES

A Development Permit is required whenever a development will involve any clearing, grading, and/or any
form of land disturbance caused by movement of earth or increase in storm water runoff due to the
decrease of soil permeability. A Soil Erosion, Sediment, and Drainage Control Plan will be required and
must be submitted to the City Engineer for approval. *Contact the Engineer’s Office for more
information at (731) 425-8220. (Permits are obtained at the Planning Department for commercial projects
and at the Building Department for residential projects.) A vegetative impact evaluation may be required.

Development Permit fee is $25.00
Erosion Control Drainage fee is $25.00 per acre
Vegetative Impact Evaluation fee is $50.00
RESIDENTIAL BUILDING PERMITS/FEES
Residential Building Permits are required for all construction, alteration or repairs, fences, accessory

buildings, etc. when the total value is $100.00 (one hundred dollars) or more.

FEES FOR NEW RESIDENTIAL

LESS THAN 1000 SQ. FT. MIN. FEE $140.00

1000 SQ. FT. TO 2000 SQ. FT. $150.00 PLUS $.18 PER SQ. FT.
OVER 1000 SQ. FT.

2001 SQ. FT. TO 3000 SQ. FT. $275.00 PLUS $.20 PER SQ. FT.
OVER 2000 SQ. FT.

3001 SQ. FT. TO 4000 SQ. FT. $450.00 PLUS $.22 PER SQ. FT.

MORE THAN 4001 SQ. FT. $500.00 PLUS $.24 PER SQ. FT.

ADDITIONS/ALTERATIONS $4.00 PER THOUSAND WITH A
MINIMUM FEE OF $40.00

Residential Building Demolition permit fee is $50.00.

The above fees shall be based on square feet of heated areas (all levels) plus one-third of the square feet
of unheated areas and areas under roof calculated as follows:

(A) Heated areas are measured along outside of exterior walls.

(B) Unheated areas and areas under roof such as garages, unfinished basements, carports,
covered patios, etc. shall be measured along their outside walls of supports.



CURRENT FEES

COMMERCIAL BUILDING PERMITS/FEES

Commercial Building Permits are required for all construction, alterations or repairs, fences, accessory
buildings, ete. when the total value is $100.00 (one hundred dollars) or more.

PERMIT FEES OTHER THAN RESIDENTIAL

*VALUATION
LESS THAN $50,000 $8.00 PER THOUSAND WITH A
MINIMUM OF $40.00
$50,001 TO $500,000 $400 FOR THE FIRST $50,000
PLUS $3.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF
$500,001 TO $1,000,000 $1600 FOR THE FIRST $500,0060
PLUS $4.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF
OVER $1,000,000 $3000 FOR THE FIRST $1,000,000

PLUS $2.50 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF

*The costs of site preparation need not be included. Also for the purpose of Building Permit Fee
calculation, the costs of items covered by the Fire Safety Permits may be deducted. Regarding the
valuation, we reserve the right to require a detail breakdown of costs should the submitted valuation be
fess than 75% of the national average for the type construction and occupancy involved.




COMMERCIAL BUILDING PERMITS/FEES

Commercial Building Permits are required for all construction, alterations or repairs, fences, accessory
buildings, etc. when the total value is $100.00 (one hundred dollars) or more.

PERMIT FEES OTHER THAN RESIDENTIAL

*VALUATION
LESS THAN $50,000 $10.00 PER THOUSAND WITH A
MINIMUM OF $50.00
$50,001 TO $500,000 $400 FOR THE FIRST $50,000
PLUS $3.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF
$500,001 TO $1,000,000 $1600 FOR THE FIRST $500,000
PLUS $4.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF
OVER $1,000,000 $3000 FOR THE FIRST $1,000,000

PLUS $2.50 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF

Commercial Building Demolition fee is $75.00.

*The costs of site preparation need not be included. Also for the purpose of Building Permit Fee
calculation, the costs of items covered by the Fire Safety Permits may be deducted. Regarding the
valuation, we reserve the right to require a detail breakdown of costs should the submitted valuation be
less than 75% of the national average for the type construction and occupancy involved.

Please note that when projects are fast-tracked, permit fees are calculated from base 0 for each phase.



CURRENT FELES

ELECTRICAL PERMITS/FEES

All electrical work requires a permit except for routine maintenance.
Fees for electrical permits shall be as follows:

Residential

Low Voltage Permit required for telephone, cable TV, burglar/security, fiber optic, camera
systems, sound intercom systems, computer and data. Fee is $25.00.

Minimum fee for modification of an existing system shall be $25.00.

Fee for inspection of a temporary service shall be $30.00.

Fee for a temporary service entrance inspection shall be $30.00.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.

Low Voltage $25.00
0-30 amps $30.00
31-60 amps $40.00
61-200 amps $50.00
201-400 amps $60.00
401-600 amps $75.00
601-1000 amps $100.00
Commercial

$0.50 per amp on commercial electrical projects 100 amps and above.

Example: On a commercial project requiring a 400 amp service, the new permit fee would be $200.00.
Whereas the old fee would have been $60.00.

Low Voltage Permit required for telephone, cable TV, burglar/security, fiber optic, camera
systems, sound intercom systems, computer and data, Fee is $25.00.

When a low voltage project is $25,000.00 or greater a fee of $100.00(one hundred dolars) will be
charged.

Minimum fee for modification of an existing system shall be $100.00.
Fee for inspection of a temporary service shall be $30.00.

Fee for a temporary service entrance inspection shall be $30.00.
When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shali be charged.



PLAN REVIEW FEES

When the valuation of the proposed commercial construction exceeds $1,000, the project is subject to a
plan review fee. Said fee is equal to one-half of the Building Permit fee as calculated on previous page
with a minimum of $75.00.

Fast Track Review Fees are based on two-thirds of the Building Permit fee as calculated on previous page
with a minimum of $75.00.

When plans are submitted one paper copy and one digital copy are required.
ELECTRICAL PERMITS/FEES

All electrical work requires a permit except for routine maintenance.

Fees for electrical permits shall be as follows:

Residential

Low Voltage Permit required for telephone, cable TV, burglar/security, fiber optic, camera
systems, sound intercom systems, computer and data. Fee is $35.00.

Minimum fee for modification of an existing system shall be $25.00.

Fee for inspection of a temporary service shall be $30.00.

Fee for a temporary service entrance inspection shall be $30.00.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.

Low Voltage $25.00
0-30 amps $30.00
31-60 amps $40.00
61-200 amps $50.00
201-400 amps $60.00
401-600 amps $75.00
601-1000 amps $100.00
Commercial

A minimum fee of $100.00 is charged for electrical permits up to 200 amps.
Commercial electrical permits exceeding 200 amps are $0.50 per amp.
Minimum fee for modification of an existing system shall be $100.00.

Fee for inspection of a temporary service shall be $30.00.

Fee for a temporary service entrance inspection shall be $30.00.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.

Low Voltage Permit required for telephone, cable TV, burglar/security, fiber optic, camera
systems, sound intercom systems, computer and data. Fee is $35.00.

When a low voltage project is $25,000.00 or greater a fee of $100.00(one hundred dollars) will be
charged.



CURRENT FEES

FIRE SAFETY PERMITS/FEES
Fire safety permits are required for the following work when the value of said work exceeds $100.

Sprinkler system(s)

Standpipe(s)

Domestic sprinkler head(s)

Foam extinguishing system(s)

Halon extinguishing system(s)

Wet chemical extinguishing system(s)
Dy chemical extinguishing system(s)
CO2 extinguishing system(s)

Fire alarm system(s)

Hood and duct exhaust system(s)
Fuel dispensing system(s)

*Valuation

L.ESS THAN $50,000 $8.00 PER THOUSAND WITH A
MINIMUM OF $40.00

$50,001 TO $500,000 $400 FOR THE FIRST $50,000
PLUS $3.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREQF

$500,001 TO $1,000,000 $1,600 FOR THE FIRST $500,000
PLUS $4.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREQF

OVER $1,000,000 $3,000 FOR THE FIRST $1,000,000

PLUS $2.50 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF

*For the purposes of Building Permit Fee calculation, the costs of items covered by the Fire Safety
Permits may be deducted from the building valuation.



FIRE SAFETY PERMITS/FEES

Sprinkler system(s)

Standpipe(s)

Domestic sprinkler head(s)

Foam extinguishing system(s)

Halon extinguishing system(s)

Wet chemical extinguishing system(s)
Dry chemical extinguishing system(s)
CO2 extinguishing system(s)

Fire alarm system(s)

Hood and duct exhaust system(s)
Fuel dispensing system(s)

*Valuation

LESS THAN §$50,000

$50,001 TO $500,000

$500,001 TO $1,000,000

OVER §$1,000,000

Fire safety permits are required for the following work when the value of said work exceeds $100.

$10.00 PER THOUSAND WITH A
MINIMUM OF $50.00

$400 FOR THE FIRST $50,000
PLUS $3.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF

$1,600 FOR THE FIRST $500,000
PLUS $4.00 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF

$3,000 FOR THE FIRST $1,000,000
PLUS $2.50 FOR EACH ADDITIONAL
THOUSAND OR FRACTION THEREOF

*For the purposes of Building Permit Fee calculation, the costs of items covered by the Fire Safety
Permits may be deducted from the building valuation.



CURRENT FEES

GAS PERMITS/FEES

All gas piping work requires a permit except for the setting or connecting of an appliance for which
piping is in place and for the repair of leaks in detached one and two family dwellings.

Fee for gas permits shall be as follows:

A fee for issuing each permit and the inspections shall be $25.00 plus the following:

For inspecting conversion burners, floor furnaces, incinerators, boilers, wall furnaces, water
heaters, or central heating or air conditioning units, the fee shall be $15.00 for each unit.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.

CURRENT FEES
PLUMBING PERMITS/FEES

Permits are required to install, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove, convert or replace any plumbing
work,

Fees for plumbing permits shall be as follows:
For issuing each permit $25.00
Plus the following when provided:

| For each plumbing fixture, floor drain or trap
| (including water and drainage pipe) $ 5.00

For each house sewer $10.00
For each house sewer being repaired $10.00
For each water heater $ 5.00
Pipe repair or water treating equipinent $10.00
é Backflow proteciive devices $10.00
| When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.

i
F.
:
:




GAS PERMITS/FEES

All gas piping work requires a permit except for the setting or connecting of an appliance for which
piping is in place and for the repair of leaks in detached one and two family dwellings.

Fee for gas permits shall be as follows:
A fee for issuing each permit and the inspections shall be $35.00 plus the following;:
For inspecting conversion burners, floor furnaces, incinerators, boilers, wall furnaces, water
heaters, or central heating or air conditioning units, gas logs, and ranges the fee shall be $15.00

for each unit.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.

PLUMBING PERMITS/FEES

Permits are required to install, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove, convert or replace any plumbing
work.

Fees for plumbing permits shall be as follows:
For issuing each permit $35.00

Plus the following when provided:
For each plumbing fixture, floor drain or trap

(including water and drainage pipe) $ 5.00
For each house sewer $10.00
For each house sewer being repaired $10.00
For each water heater $ 5.00
Pipe repair or water treating equipment $10.00
Backflow protective devices $10.00

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.



CURRENT FEES

MECHANICAL PERMITS/FEES

Permits are required to install, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove, convert or replace any mechanical
system,

Fees for mechanical permits shall be as follows:

For issuing each permit and inspections, a fee of $25.00 for the permit plus $15.00 for the first
$1000 of valuation of the installation plus $3.00 for each additional fraction thereof.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.




MECHANICAL PERMITS/FEES

Permits are required to install, enlarge, alter, repair, improve, remove, convert or replace any mechanical
system.

Fees for mechanical permits shall be as follows:

For issuing each permit and inspections, a fee of $35.00 for the permit plus $20.00 for the first
$1000 of valuation of the installation plus $4.00 for each additional fraction thereof.

When a re-inspection is required, a fee of $25.00 shall be charged.



CURRENT FEES

SIGN PERMITS/FEES

Sign permits are required to erect, construct, enlarge, move or convert any sign, except for exempt signs
as permitted in Article VI Exempt Signs of the Sign Code.

Drawings or sketches are required for sign permits,

Sign permit fees are as follows:

MINIMUM FEE $15.00
ON PREMISE SIGN $1.00 PER SQ. FT.
OFF PREMISE SIGN $1.00 PER SQ. FT.

BILLBOARD FEES ARE THE SAME AS COMMERCIAL BUILDING PERMIT FEES AND ARE
SUBJECT TO PLAN REVIEW FEES. STAMPED DRAWINGS ARE REQUIRED FOR BILLBOARD
STRUCTURES.

Section 21-13 (3) Five Dollars ($5.00) recertification for a licensed sign company and Ten Dollars
($10.00) when inspected by the city.

Section 21-46 (A) Electrical permit shall be required for any electrical connections and/or reconnections.

Please note that the Sign Code is related to the Zoning Ordinance and sign restrictions are by zone. It is
important to insure that your proposed sign is appropriate for the zone in which it is to be located.



Sign permits are required to erect, construct, enlarge, move or convert any sign, except for exempt signs
as permitted in Article VI Exempt Signs of the Sign Code.

Drawings or sketches are required for sign permits.

Sign permit fees are as follows:

MINIMUM FEE $25.00
ON PREMISE SIGN $1.00 PER SQ. FT.
OFF PREMISE SIGN $1.00 PER SQ. FT.

BILLBOARD FEES ARE THE SAME AS COMMERCIAL BUILDING PERMIT FEES AND ARE
SUBJECT TO PLAN REVIEW FEES. STAMPED DRAWINGS ARE REQUIRED FOR BILLBOARD
STRUCTURES.

Section 21-13 (3) Five Dollars ($5.00) recertification for a licensed sign company and Ten Dollars
($10.00) when inspected by the city.

Section 21-46 (A) Electrical permit shall be required for any electrical connections and/or reconnections.

Please note that the Sign Code is related to the Zoning Ordinance and sign restrictions are by zone. It is
important to insure that your proposed sign is appropriate for the zone in which it is to be located.



AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE
OFFICIAL CODE OF THE CITY OF JACKSON
RELATIVE TO TITLE 7, CHAPTER 2 FIRE CODE

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF JACKSON THE
FOLLOWING:

SECTION 1. That the text of the Official Code of the City of Jackson, Title 7
FIRE PROTECTION AND FIREWORKS, CHAPTER 2 FIRE CODE, be deleted in its
entirety and replaced with the following:

CHAPTER 2
FIRE CODE

SECTION
7-201. Adoption.

7-201. Adoption._ Pursuant to the authority granted by Tennessee Code
Annotated, section 6-54-502 et seq. and for the purpose of providing regulations
consistent with nationally recognized practices for the reasonable protection of life
and property from the hazards of fire and explosion due to storage, use or handling of
hazardous materials, substances and devices, and to minimize hazards to life and
property due to fire, the 2018 International Fire Code (Fourth Printing), as prepared
by the International Codes Council International, Inc., excluding all appendices
thereto, and containing certain modifications, is hereby adopted and incorporated by
reference as a part of this code of ordinances.

SECTION 2. That Exhibit A, attached to this ordinance, represents all
modifications contained in the aforementioned codes being adopted and incorporated by
reference in the Official Code of the City of Jackson by the passage of this ordinance.

SECTION 3. That this ordinance becomes effective on January 1, 2022, the
public welfare requiring it.

MAYOR

INTRODUCED:

ADOPTED:




EXHIBIT A

MODIFICATIONS

2018 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE (FOURTH PRINTING)

. On page 1, 2018 IEBC Insert

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the FExisting Building Code of [the City of
Jackson, TIN], hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Amend the following:

Section 101

Add:

101.4.3 Existing Buildings. Existing buildings intended fo be occupied that have been vacant for a period
of two (2) vears or more shall comply with all requirements of the currently adopted codes.

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (FOURTH PRINTING)

On page 1, 2018 IBC Insert

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of [the City of Jackson, TN],
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Amend the following:

Section 102

Add:

102.6.3 Existing Buildings. Existing buildings intended to be occupied that have been vacant for a period
of two (2) vears or more shall comply with all requirements of the currently adopted codes.

SECTION 105
PERMITS

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permir requirements of this code shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this
code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:
Building:

Delete the following:



Replace with the following:

2. Al fences within this jurisdiction requirve g permit. All fence permits must hqve prior approval from the
Planning Depariment.

Delete the following:

Replace with the following:

4. All retaining walls within_this_jurisdiction_require a permit, All relaining walls must _have prior
approval from the Engineering Department.

Amend the following:

Section 904

Add:

[F] 904.2.3 Domestic Cooking Applionces in Other than Group R. In other than Group R occupancies,
where domestic cooktops, ranges, and open-top broilers, (etc.) are used for domestic purposes, domestic
cooking exhaust systems shall be provided and shall be protected with an approved automatic fire-
extinguishing system installed in accordance with this code.

On page 392, 2018 IBC Insert

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the applicable governing
authority shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a
minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in
an engineering report entitled "The Flood Insurance Study for [the City of Jackson],” dated [July 7, 1983], as
amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and Fiood

Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data along with any revisions thereto. The
adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be part
of this section.

2017 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (54™ EDITION)

On page 70-31 Amend the following:

Add:



90.4.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Electric Code (NFPA 70} of the City of Jackson, TN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

On page 70-99, Amend the following:

Article 240.24
(E) Not located in Bathrooms. In dwelling units, dormitories, and guest rooms or guest suites,
overcurrent devices, other than supplementary overcurrent protection, shall not be located in bathrooms.

Add the following:
(1) Overcurrent devices shall not be installed in bathrooms of commercial buildings.
(2.) Overcurrent devices shall not be_installed in rooms containing, but not limited to, one of the
following: water heaters, sinks including mop sinks, backflow preventers, and floor drains, efc.

Exception: A minimum clearance of six feet in any direction can be maintained from the electrical panel to any item
listed in #2 above.

(3.) Electrical panels are required to be g minimum of six inches from the finished floor or finished
grade to the bottom of the panel.

On pages 70-269-270, Amend the following:

Article 410.36 Means of Support

(B) Suspended Ceiling. Framing members of suspended ceiling systems used to support luminaires shall
be securely fastened to each other and shall be securely attached to the building structure at appropriate
intervals, Luminaires shall be securely fastened to the ceiling framing member by mechanical means such
as bolts, screws, or rivet. Listed clips identified for use with the type of ceiling framing member(s) and
luminaire(s) shall also be permitted.

Add the following:

(1.) Clips shall not be used as the sole support for “lay-in” Iuminaires installed in a suspended
ceiling. Screws or tie wires installed in opposite_corners of the luminaire(s) fastened to the framing
member(s) shall be required.

2018 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (THIRD PRINTING)

On page 1, 2018 IRC Insert:

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Residential Code of the City of Jackson, TN, hereinafter
referred to as “this code.”

On page, 3-4, amend the following:



R105.2 Work exempt from permit.
Building:

Delete the following:

Electrical:

Delete the following:

4. Electriecdwirine. devices, appliances, apparatys or equipment operating at less than 23 volts

and not capable of supplyving more than 50 watts of energy,

On page 32, amend the following:(Filled in specifications in table)

TABLE R301.2(1)

CLIMATIC AND GEQGRAPHIC DESIGN

CRITERIA
GROUND WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM WINTER |  ICE BARRIER
SNOW DESIGN DESIGN | UNDERLAYMENT
LOAD Speed | Topographic | Specialwind| Windborne CATEGORY Weathering | Frostiine Termite TEMP REQUIRED
{o} {mph) effects region | debris zone (f) {a) depth {© ) )
() (k) () (m) tb)

10 PSF {115 mph No No No D1 Moderate 13" Modarate 18°F Yes e
to Heay 1C: 47113C0033E
Y H7113C0135E4
117113C0145E4
¥7113CO154E4
©¥7113C0161E4
¥7113C0164E4
47113C0169E,4
M7113C0277EA
M7113C0282E4°
M7113C0291E d:

For SI: | pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa, | mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

a. Where weathering requires a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural requirements of this
code, the frost line depth strength required for weathering shall govern. The weathering column shall be filled in with the weathering index,
"negligible,” “moderate” or "severe" for concrete as determined from Figure R301.2(4) The grade of masonry units shall be determined from
ASTIM C34, €55, C62, C73, C90. €129, C145, C216 or C652.

b. Where the frost line depth requires deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403,1(1), the frost line depth strength required for weathering
shall govern. The jurisdiction shall fill in the frost line depth cofumn with the minimum depth of footing below finish grade,

¢. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on whether there has been a history of local
subterranean termite damage.

d. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map [Figure R301.2{5)A]. Wind exposure
category shall be determined on a site-specific basis in accordance with Section R301.2.1.4.



e. The outdeor design dry-bulb temperature shall be selected from the columns of 97 Y/i-percent values for winter from Appendix D of the
International Plumbing Code. Deviations from the Appendix D temperatures shall he permitted to reflect local climates or local weather
experience as determined by the building official. [Also see Figure R301.2(1).]

f. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category determined from Section R301.2.2.1,

g. The jurisdiction shall filf in this part of the table with {a} the date of the jurisdictions entry into the National Flood Insurance Program (date of
adoption of the first code or ordinance for management of flood hazard areas), (b} the date(s) of the Flood Insurance Study and (¢} the panel
numbers and dates of the currently effective FIRMs and FBFMs or other flood hazard map adopted by the authority having jurisdiction, as
amended.

h. In accordance with Sections R905.1.2, R905.4.3.1, R905.5.3,1, R905.6.3.1, R905.7.3.1 and R905.8.3. 1, where there has been a history of
local damage from the effects of ice damming, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with "YES." Otherwise. the jurisdiction shall fill
in this part of the table with "NO."

i. The jurisdiction shail fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air freezing index {BF-days) from Figure R4()3.3(2} or from
the 100-year (99 percent) value on the National Climatic Data Center data table "Air Freezing Index-USA Method {Base 32°F)."

J. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature from the National Climatic Data Center data table "Air
Freezing Index-USA Method {Base 32°F).”

k. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.5, where there is focal historical data documenting structural damage to buildings due to topographic
wind speed-up effects, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with -'YES." Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO" in this part
of the table.

1. In accordance with Figare R301.2{5)A, where there is local historical data documenting unusual wind conditions, the jurisdiction shalt filt in
this part of the table with "YES™ and identify any specific requirements. Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NG" in this part of the
table.

m. | accordance with Section 1001.2.1.2 the jurisdiction shall indicate the wind-borne debris wind zone(s), Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall
indicate "NO" in this part of the table,

n. The jurisdiction shall fill in these sections of the table to establish the design criteria using Table 1a or 1b from ACCA Manual | or established
criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

o. The jurisdiction shall filt in this section of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in Figure R301.2(6}.

Delete the following:

Mamal ] Desion Criterialisted-in Table R361-2(1):

On page 60, amend the following:

‘ Delete the following:
|

M%#gméémmmwmmmmeﬁmﬁ%&m (35-mm)
thiskor 20-minute-fire-rated doors;-equipped-with-aself closing or-automatic-closing-deviee

Replace with the following:

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for
sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall
be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1 /s inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid or
honey-comb-core steel doors not less than 13/s inches (35 mm) thick, 20-minute fire-rated doors,
or a steel or wood door meeting the building thermal envelope requirements of the 2018 IRC
chapter 11 or 2018 IECC chapter 4.




On page 69,

Garages and Carports

Delete in its entirety the following:

On pages 75, amend the following:

Delete the following:

Replace with the following:

R313.1 Townhouses automatic fire sprinkler system. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall not be required if a
2-hour fire resistance rated wall exist between units, if such walls do not contain, plumbing and/or mechanical
equinment,_ducts, or vents in the common wall

R313.2 One and twe faomily dwellings automatic five sprinkler systems. An awtomatic residential fire sprinkler
system in one_and two-family dwellings is optional.




R313.2.1 Design and installation. When an qutomatic residential fire sprinkler system is
installed it shall be desioned and installed in accordgnce with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D,

On page, 87, amend the following:

Delete the following:

Replace with the following:

Section R326 Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs:
SECTION 326
BARRIER REQUIREMENTS

326.1 General.

The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of barriers for restricting entry into areas having
pools and spas. Where spas or hot tubs are equipped with a lockable safety cover complying with ASTM
F1346 and swimming pools are equipped with a powered safety cover that complies with ASTM F1346,
the areas where those spas, hot tubs or pools are located shall not be required to comply with Sections
326.2 through 326.7.

326.2 Outdoor swimming pools and spas.

Outdoor nools and spas and indoor swimming pools shall be surrounded by a barrier that complies with
Sections 326.2. 1 through 326.7.

326.2.1 Barrier height and clearances,

Barrier heights and clearances shall be in accordance with all of the following.

1. The top of the barrier shall be not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) above grade where measured
on the side of the barrier that faces away from the pool or spa, Such height shall exist around the entire
perimeter of the barrier and for a distance of 3 feet (914 mm) measured horizontally from the outside of
the required barrier.

2. The vertical clearance between orade and the bottom of the barrier shall not exceed 2 inches
(51 mm) for grade surfaces that are not solid_such as grass or gravel, where measured on the side of the
barrier that faces away from the pool or spa,

3. The vertical clearance between g surface below the barrier to a solid surface, such as
concrete, and the bottom of the required barrier shall not exceed 4 inches (102 mm) where measured on
the side of the required barrier that faces away from the pool or spa.

4. Where the top of the pool or spa structure is above grade, the barrier shall be installed on
grade or shall be mounted on top of the pool or spa structure. Where the barvier is mounted on the top of




the pool or spa, the vertical clearance between the top of the pool or spa and the bottom of the barrier
shall not exceed 4 inches (102 mm),

326.2.2 Openings.

Openings in the barrier shall not allow passage of a 4-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere.

326.2.3 Solid barrier surfaces.

Solid barriers that do not have openings shall not contain indentations or protrusions that form
handholds and footholds, excent for normal construction tolerances and tooled masonry joints.

326.2.4 Mesh fence as a barrier.

Mesh fences, other than chain link fences in accordance with Section 326.2.7, shall be installed in
accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and shall comply with the following:

1. The bottom of the mesh fence shall be nof more thanl inch (25 mm) above the deck or installed
surface or grade.

2. The maximum vertical clearance from the bottom of the mesh fence and the solid surface shall
not permit the fence to be lifted more than 4 inches (102 mm) from grade or decking.

3. The fence shall be designed and constructed so that it does not allow passage of a 4-inch (102
mm) sphere under any mesh panel. The maximum vertical clearance from the bottom of the mesh fence
and the solid surface shall be not greater than 4 inches (102 wmm) from grade or decking.

4. An attachment device shall attach each barrier section at ¢ height not lower than 43 inches
(1143 mm) above grade. Common attachment devices include, but are not limited to, devices that provide
the security equal 1o or greater than that of a hook-and-eye-type latch incorporating a spring-actuated
retaining lever such as g safety gate hook.

5. Where a hinged gate is used with a mesh fence, the gate shall comply with Section 326.3.

6. Patio deck sleeves such as vertical post recepiacles that ave placed inside the patio surface
shall be of a nonconductive material,

7. Mesh fences shall not be installed on top of onground residential pools.

326.2.5 Closely spaced horizontal members.

Where the barrier is composed of horizontal and vertical members and the distance between the tops of
the horizontal members is less than 45 inches (1143 mm), the horizontal members shall be located on the
pool or spa side of the fence. Spacing between vertical members shall not exceed 1-3/4 inches (44 mm) in
width. Where there are decorative cutouts within vertical members, spacing within the cutouts shall not
exceed 1-3/4 inches (44 mm) in width,

326.2.6 Widely spaced horizontal members.

Where the barrier is composed of horizontal and vertical members and the distance between the tops of
the horizontal members is 45 inches (1143 mm) or more, spacing between vertical members shall not
exceed 4 inches (102 mm), Where there are decorative cutouts within vertical members, the interior width
of the cutouts shall not exceed 1-3/dinches (44 mm),

326.2.7 Chain link dimensions.




The maximum opening formed by a chain link fence shall be not more than 1-3/4inches (44 mm). Where
the fence is provided with slats fastened at the top and bottom that reduce the openings, such openings
shall be not greater than 1-3/4 inches (44 mm).

326.2.8 Diagonal members.

Where the barrier is com-posed of diagonal members, the maximum opening formed by the diagonal
members shall be noi greater than 1-3/4 inches (44 mm). The angle of diggonal members shall be not
greater than 45 degrees (0.79 rad) from vertical.

326.2.9 Clear zone,

There shall be a clear zone of not less than 36 inches (914 mm) between the exterior of the barrier and
any permanent structures or equipment such as pumps, filters and heaters that can be used to climb the
barrier.

326.2.10 Poolside barrier sethacks.

The pool or spa side of the required barrier shall be not less than 20 inches (508mm) from the water’s
edge.

326.3 Gates.

Access gates shall comply with the requirements of Sections 326.3.1 through 326.3.3 and shall be
equipped to accommodate a locking device. Pedestrian access gates shall open outward away fron the
pool or spa, shall be self-closing and shall have a self-latching device.

3206.3.1 Utility or service gates,

Gates not intended for pedestrian use, such as utility or service gates, shall remain locked when not in
use.

326.3.2 Double or multiple gates.

Double gates or multiple gates shall have not fewer than one leaf secured in place and the adjacent leaf
shall be secured with a self-latching device. The sate and barrier shall not have openings larger than 1/2
inch (12.7 mm) within 18 inches (457mm) of the laich release mechanism. The self-latching device shall
comply with the requirements of Section 326.3.3.

326.3.3 Latches.

Where the release mechanism of the self-laiching device is located less than 54 inches (1372mm) from
arade, the release mechanism shall be located on the pool or spa side of the gate not less than 3 inches
(76 mm) below the top of the gate, and the gate and barrier shall not have openings greater than 1/2 inch
(12.7 mm) within 18 inches (457 mm) of the release mechanism.

326.4 Structure wall as a barrier,




Where a wall of a dwelling or structure serves as part of the barvier and where doors or windows
provide direct access to the pool or spa through that wall, one of the following shall be required:

1. Operable windows having a sill height of less than 48 inches (1219 mm)} above the indoor
finished floor and doors shall have an alarm that produces an audible warning when the window, door or
their screens are opened. The alarm shall be listed and labeled as a water hazard entrance alarm in
accordance with UL 2017. In dwellings or structures not required fo be Accessible units, Type A units or
Type B units, the operable parts of the alarm deactivation switches shall be located 54 inches (1372 mm)
or more above the finished floor. In dwellings or siructures required to be Accessible units, Tvpe A units
or Type B units, the operable parts of the alarm deactivation switches shall be located not greater than 54
inches (1372 mm) and not less than 48 inches (1219 pun) above the finished floor.

2. A safety cover that is listed and labeled in accordance with ASTM F1346 is installed for the
pools and spas.

3. An approved means of protection, such as self-closing doors with self-latching devices, is
provided. Such means of protection shall provide a degree of protection that is not less than the
protection afforded by Item 1 or2,

326.5 Onground residential pool structure as o barrier.

An on-ground residential pool wall structure or a barrier mounted on top of an on-ground residential
ool wall structure shall serve as a barrier where all of the following conditions are present:

1. Where only the pool wall serves as the barrier, the boi-tom of the wall is on grade, the top of
the wall is not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) above grade for the entire perimeter of the pool, the wall
complies with the requirements of Section 326.2 and the pool manufacturer allows the wall (o serve as a
barrier.

2. Where a barrier is mounted on top of the pool wall_the top of the barvier is not less than 48
inches (1219 mm) above erade for the entire perimeter of the pool, and the wall and the barrier on top of
the wall comply with the requirements of Section 326.2.

3. Ladders or steps used as means of access to the pool are capable of being secured, locked or
removed to prevent access except where the ladder or steps are surrounded by a barvier that meets the
requirements of Section 326.

4. Openings created by the securing, locking or removal of ladders and steps do not allow the
passage of a 4-inch (102 mm} diameter sphere.

5. Barriers that are mounted on top of onground residential pool walls are installed in
accordance with the pool manufacturer’s instructions.

326.6 Natural barriers,

In the case where the pool or spa area abuts the edge of a lake or other natural body of water, public
access is not permitted or allowed along the shoreline, and required barriers extend to and beyond the
water’s edge not less than 18 inches (457 mm), a barrier is not required between the natural body of
water shoreline and the pool or spa.

326.7 Natural topography.

Natural topography that prevents direct access to the pool or spa areq shall include but not be limited to
mountains and natural rock formations. A natural barrier approved by the governing body shall be
acceptable provided that the degree of protection is noi less than the protection afforded by the
requirements of Sections 326.2 through 326.5,




On page 459, delete Chapter 11 in its entirety:

Replace with Chapter 4 “Residential Energy Efficiency” from the 2012 International Energy
Conservation Code (second printing):

On page R-29, delete the following:

Building Thermal Envelope

On page R-34, delete the following:

R403.2.2 Sealing (Mandatory).




On page, 581, amend the following:
Delete the following:

G2417.4.1 (406 4.1) Test pressure. Iheiesparessu#ei&b&used&ha#be%@es&%#;ﬂme&the

Replace with the following:

G2417.4.1 (406.4.1) Test pressure. The test pressure fo be ysed shall be not less than 40 psig (100 kPa
gauge). Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig (862 kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed g
vaiue that produces a hoop siress in the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum yield
strength of the pipe.

On page 620, 2018 IRC Amend the Following:
Insert the Following:
P2603.5.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be installed not less

than [Nineteen (19)] inches (483mm) below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection. Building sewers
shall be installed not less than [Nineteen (19)] inches (483mm) below grade.

On page, 719, amend the following:

E3705.7 Location of overcurrent devices in or on premises.
Circuit breakers and switches containing fuses shall:

add the following:

7. Be located no closer than 3 feet to any source of water, such as sinks, showers, tubs, water
heaters, hose bibs, backflow preventers, elc.

8 Electrical panels are required to be a minimum of six inches from _the finished floor or finished
grade to the bottom of the panel,




On Page 921, Appendix Q insert the following:

A0101.2 Ready Removable. TCA 68-126-303 — TCA 68-126-311 — City of Jackson
“Ready Removable” means a structure without any foundation, footing, or other support mechanisms that allow a
structure to be easily relocated but which may include electrical wiring.

1. “Ready Removable” siructures include, but are not limited to, portable units, stadium press boxes, guard
shelters, structure that conlain only electrical_portable accessory style storage upits, sheds, off-sit builds
or similar structures.

2. Offsite builds “ready removable” for residential uses musi be inspected and approved by the State of
Tennessee in the same manner as manufactured housing with approved placards attached to the structure,

3. No ready removable shall be modified for use as residential,_recreational, or emergency housing in the
City of Jackson, TN or the State of Tennessee,

4 A “Ready Removabie” musi be constructed in accordance to the requirements of the current adopted
Internationgl Residential Code.

2018 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE (SECOND PRINTING)

City of Jackson Zoning Ordinance.

Section 11-806.

Barbed Wire Fences. The use of barbed wire, spikes, nails, or any other sharp point or instrument of any
kind on top or on the sides of any fence is prohibited.

Provided, however, that within industrial areas as provided in the zoning ordinance of the City of
Jackson or around industrial plants which are nonconforming uses within the City of Jackson barbed
wire may be installed to chain link fences in those cases where such chain link fence is at least six (6) feet
above sidewalk or street level, provided the barbed wire overhang be attached to forty-five (45) degree
brackets projecting over private property. (1972 Code 19-5)

No fences in any zoning district shall contain an electric charge or be connected with electric current.

Approved fence materials- materials normally mamufactured for, used as, and recognized as, fencing
materials such as: wrought ivon or other decorative metals suitable for the construction of fences, fired
masonry, concrete, stone, metal tubing, wood planks, chain link and vinyl composite manufactured
specifically as fencing materials. Fence materials must also be materials approved for exierior use that
are weather and decay-resistant. The provisions of this Ordinance are not intended fo prevent the
installation of any material or to prohibit any design or method of construction not specifically
prescribed by this Ordinance, provided that any such alternative has been approved by the Chief Building
Official, or his designee. An alternative material, design or method of construction shall be approved
where the Chief Building Official finds that the proposed design is satisfactory and complies with the
intent of the provisions of this Ordinance and that the material, method or work offered is, for the
purpose intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in this Ordinance in quality, strength,
effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and safety.

On page 1, amend the following:



2018 IPMC Insert

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of the City of Jackson, TN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

On page 2, amend the following:

Delete the following:

[A}103.5-Fees+he !eie.s © ast!”t’lelsa“d Services lple e“‘Eeﬁ oy i edlepal tl' ‘*e Hiearying-outits

JHURISDICTION-TOINSERT ARRROPRIATE SCHEDULE.]
Replace with the following:

[A] 103.5 Fees. The department may estabfish necessary fees for the activities and services performed
by the department in carrying out ils responsibilities under this code. Those fees shall be made available
for public inspection upon request,

On page 6, amend the following:

ADD:

Section 110.5

Concrete and/or asphalt Removal. During demolition of a structure, all concrete and/or asphall on the
site shall be removed with the exception of public sidewalks. Any public sidewalk damaged or removed
during the demolition process shall be repaired or replaced at the expense of the demolition contractor or
the property owner.

ADD:

Section 110.6

Site protection. Upon completion of demolition of a structure the site must be graded and fill provided
where needed. Fill shall be firee of vegetation and foreign material. Where the depth of fill exceeds
thirteen (13) inches the fill shall be properly compacted in eight (8) inch lifis and shall be compacted to a
minimum of 935 percent of maximum density. Compaction shall be tested by an approved testing
laboratory and test results submitted to the Building Department. Seed and straw, or sod, as well as silt
fencing may be required to prevent excess water runoff.

On page 7, amend the following:

Insert:



[A] 112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a
stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than [$1] one dollar per day or more than [$50] fifty dollars per day.

On page 11, amend the following:
Insert:

302.4 Weeds. Premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds or plant growth in
excess of [Six Inches (6")]. Noxious weeds shall be prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses,
annual plants and vegetation, other than trees or shrubs provided; however, this term shall not include
cuitivated flowers and gardens.

On page 13, amend the following:

Insert:

304.14 Insect screens. During the period from [April 1] to [November 30], every door, window and other
outside opening required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or
any areas where products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed,
manufactured, packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of minimum 16
mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door used for insect control shall have a self-
closing device in good working condition.

Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved means, such as air curtains or insect
repellent fans, are employed.

On page 14, amend the following:

ADD:

Section 304.20

Open Storage. No open storage is permitted on any residential property, except for approved outdoor
items. (Temporary barriers shall not be used fo enclose storage; tarps, tents, cloth, etc. shall not be used
to conceal outdoor storage.) Indoor furniture, equipment, appliances, building materials, etc. shall not be
stored outdoors. Laundry hune from fences, porches and clotheslines to the front of a structure is

prohibited.

On page 23, amend the following:
Insert:
602.3 Heat supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or more

dwelling units or sfeeping units on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants
thereof shall supply heat during the period from [October 1] to [April 30] to maintain a minimum temperature



of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms.
Exceptions:

1. When the outdoor temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature for the locality,
maintenance of the minimum room temperature shall not be required provided that the heating system is
operating at its full design capacity. The winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as
indicated in Appendix D of the International Plumbing Code.

2. In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30°F (-1°C}, a minimum
temperature of 65°F (18°C) shall be maintained.

602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat during the
period from [October 1] to [April 30] to maintain a minimum temperature of 65°F (18°C) during the period the
spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special temperature conditions.
2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical activities.

2012 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE (Second PRINTING)

On page C-3 and R-3, 2018 IECC Insert

|A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Energy Code of the City of Jackson, TN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

On page C-95 through C-99, delete in its entirety:

On page R-33, delete the following:

Building Thermal Envelope




On page R-34, delete the following:

R403.2.2 Sealing (Mandatory).

2018 INTERNATIONAL FULIL GAS CODE (THIRD PRINTING)

On page 1, 2018 IFGC Insert

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Gas Code of the City of Jackson, IN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”




On page 5, 2018 IFGC Amend the FoHowing:
Delete the foHowing:
[JURISDICTION-TO-INSERT ARPPROPRIATE SCHEDULE]
Replace with the following:
[A] 106.6.2 Fees, The department may establish necessary fees for the activities and setvices performed

by the department in carrying out its responsibilities under this code. Those fees shall be made available
for public inspection upon request,

Delete the following:

On page 7, 2018 IFGC Amend the Following:

Delete the following:

On page 7, 2018 IFGC Amend the Following:

Insert the following:

[A] 108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official that work is being performed contrary to
the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shaill immediately cease. Such
notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, the owner’s authorized agent, or
the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to
resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to
stopping the work. Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with
a stop work order, except such work as that person fs directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable for a fine of not less than ($1] one dollar per day or more than [$50] fifty dollars per day.

On page, 74, amend the following:

Delete the following:



406. 4 1 Test pressure. The-test pressure-to-be-used shall-be-net-less than-1+/22 timesthe-propesed
ot-lessthan-3-psig-{20-kPa-gauge);-irrespective-of- design-pressure:

Replace with the following:

406.4.1 Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shafl be not less than 40 psig (100 kPa gauge).
Where the fest pressure exceeds 125 psig (862 kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed a value
that produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum vield strength

of the pipe.

2018 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (THIRD PRINTING)

On page 1, 2018 IPC Insert

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Plumbing Code of the City of Jackson, TN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

On page 5, 2018 TPC Amend the Following:

Delete the following:

[JURISDICTION-TO-INSERT-ARPRPRORRIATE SCHEDULE]

Replace with the following:

[A] 106.6.2 Fees. The department may establish necessary fees for the activities and services performed
by the department in carrying out its responsibilities under this code. Those fees shall be made available
for public inspection upon request,

Delete the following:

JA}106.6.3 Fee-refunds. The code-official shall-authorize-the refunding-of fees as follows:
1-The-fall amount-of-any-fee paid-hereunder that-was-erren

ew&%%ep%%&%




On page 7, 2018 IPC Amend the Following:

Delete the following:

On page 7, 2018 [PC Amend the Fellowing:

Insert the following:

[A] 108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official, work on any plumbing system that is being
performed contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such
notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s authorized agent, or to
the person performing the work, The notice shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume.
Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the
work. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be
liable to a fine of not less than [$1] one dollar per day or more than [$50] fifty dollars per day.

On page 18, 2018 TPC Amend the Following:

Insert the Following:

305.4.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be installed not less
than [Nineteen (19)] inches (483mm) below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection, Building sewers
shall be installed not less than [Ninefeen (19)] inches (483mm) below grade.

On page 73, 2018 IPC Amend the Following:

903.1 Roof extension. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated not less than [Twelve (12)]

inches (305 mm) above the roof. Where a roof is to be used for assembly or as a promenade, observation deck,
sunbathing deck or similar purposes, open vent pipes shall terminate not less than 7 feet (2134 mm) above the roof.

2018 INTERNATIONAIL MECHANICAL CODE (THIRD PRINTING)

On page 1, 2018 IMC Insert

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of [the City of Jackson,
TN, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

On page 5, 2018 IMC Amend the Following:

Delete the following:



[JURISDICTION TO-INSERT APPROPRIATE SCHEDULE]

Replace with the following:

[A] 106.5.2 Fees. The department may establish necessary fees for the activities and services performed
by the department in carrying out its responsibilities under this code. Those fees shall be made available
for public inspection upon request,

Delete the folowing:

On page 7, 2018 IMC Amend the Following:

Delete the following:

On page 7, 2018 IMC Amend the Following:

Insert the folowing:

[A] 108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the code official that mechanical work is being performed
contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shall immediately cease. Such
notice shall be in writing and shafl be given to the owner of the property, or to the owner’s authorized agent, or to
the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an
emergency exists, the code official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any
person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop work order, except such
work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shalt be liable for a

fine of not less than [81] one dollar per day or more than [$50] fifty dollars per day.

2018 INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL / A 117.1 (FOURTH PRINTING)

On page 1-1 2009 1CC/A 117.1 Insert



|A] 100 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Accessibility Code of the City of Jackson, TN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”




Currently adopted Codes by the City of Jackson:

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2018 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

2018 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2018 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE WIH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2018 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2017 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2012 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2009 ICC/ANSI A-117.1 ACCESSIBLE AND USABLE BUILDINGS AND FACILITIES

2018 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS*

2018 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

2018 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE




EXHIBIT A

MODIFICATIONS

2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE (FOURTH PRINTING)

On page 1, 2018 IFC Insert:

[A] 101.1 Title, These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Jackson, TN,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

On page 14, 2018 IFC Insert:

[A] 110.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation
of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate
used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a [Class C Misdemeanor], punishable by a fine of not

more than [($50.00 / Day) fifty dollurs per dav] or by imprisonment not exceeding [Thirty (30) DAYS], or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be

deemed a separate offense.
On page 15, 2018 IFC Insert

[A] 112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than [$1.00/Day] one dollar per day or more than
[850.00/Day] fifty dollars per day.

Amend the following:

Delete the following:

Section 503
Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Replace with the following:

Section 503
Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of
not less than 25 feet (7620mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in




accaordance with Section 503.6. and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet

(4267, 2mm).

On page 204, 2018 IFC Insert:

1103.5.3 Group I-2, Condition 2, In addition to the requirements of Section 1103.5.2, existing
buildings of Group I-2, Condition 2 occupancy shall be equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkier system in accordance with Section 903 .3.1.1. The automatic sprinkler system shall be installed as
established by the adopting ordinance. [July 1, 20231

On page 427, 2018 IFC Insert:

5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. Storage of Class I and II
liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the
Hmits of districts in which such storage is prohibited fthe City of Jackson, TN

On page 448, 2018 IFC Insert:

5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. The storage of Class { and 1
liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited fthe City of Juckson, TN/,

On page 460, 2018 IFC Insert:

5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers outside of
buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is
prohibited [the City of Jackson, TN},

On page 478, 2018 IFC Insert:

6104,2 Maximum capacity within established limits. Within the limits established by law
restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas,
the aggregate capacity of any one instalfation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons (7570 L)
[the City of Jackson, TN].




On page 15,2018 1FC Insert new section:

Section 114

Mobile Food Service Vehicles

Section 114.1
Definitions.

The following words, terms and phrases, when used in this chapter, shall have the
meanings ascribed to them in this section, except where the context where the context
clearly indicates a different meaning:

“Canteen Trucks” —arc vehicles that operate to provide food services to employees at a
location where access to other good service is impractical (e.g. a construction site); from
which the operator vends fruits, vegetables, pre-cooked foods such as hot dogs, pre-
packaged foods, and pre-packaged drinks that require no preparation or assembly of
foods or beverages except for the heating of pre-cooked foods; and which do not
advertise in any form to the general public except by virtue of signage on the vehicle.
Canteen Trucks that operate other than as defined herein are Food Trucks and must
comply with all Food Truck Regulations.

“Mobile Food Service Vehicle” —means a Food Truck or an Ice Cream Truck and
includes any other portable unit that is attached to a motorized vehicle and that is
intended for use or in service to the operations of the Mobile Food Service Vehicle.

“Food Trucks” —are vehicles from which the operator cooks, prepares, or assembles
food items with the intent to sell such items to the general public and which may market
their products to the public via advertising, including social media.

“Operate” —means to promote or sell food, beverages, and other permitted items from
the Mobile Food Service Vehicle and includes all tenses of the work.

“Operator” —means any person owning, operating, or permitted to operate a Food Truck
and collectively refers to all such persons.

“Vehicle” —means every device in, upon, or by which any person or property is or may
be transported or drawn upon a highway, excepting devices moved by human power or
used exclusively upon stationary rails or tracks.

Section 114.2
Operating Requirements.

(1) Licensing.

Mobile Food Service Vehicles must be licensed in accordance with the rules and
regulations of any local, state, and federal agency having jurisdiction over motor vehicles
and all products sold therein must be properly licensed, permitted, and allowed by local,
state, and, federal laws or regulations.

(2) Utilities.



All Mobile Food Service Vehicles shall comply with the version of the electrical
code currently adopted by the City of Jackson and any power, water, or sewage required
for the Mobile Food Service Vehicle shall be self-contained and shall not use utilities
drawn from other sources.

(3) Fire Suppression and Extinguishers Required.

All Mobile Food Service Vehicles must be equipped with a 2-A:10-B:C fire
extinguisher that is certified annually by a licensed company. Additionally, any Mobile
Food Service Vehicle that produce grease laden vapors (e.g. those units with deep fat
fryers or flat top griddles) must be equipped with an automatic fire suppression system
installed in accordance with 2018 IMC (section 509) and installed under a type 1 hood in
accordance with 2018 IMC (section 507). Additionally, a K-Class fire extinguisher that is
certified by a licensed company will also be required in any Mobile Food Service Vehicle
that produce grease laden vapors.

(4) Waste Collection,

The area of a Mobile Food Service Vehicle operation must be kept neat and
orderly at all times. Operation of a Mobile Food Service Vehicle in an area is deemed
acceptance by the operator of the responsibility for cleanliness of the reasonable area
surrounding the operations (not less than 20 feet from all parts of the vehicle) regardless
of the occurrence or source of any waste in the area. The operator must provide proper
trash receptacles for public use that are sufficient and suitable to contain all trash
generated by the Mobile Food Service Vehicle during the period of operation at a
location. All trash within the area of operations must be removed and all garbage, trash,
and trash receptacles must be removed when full and prior to departure of a Mobile Food
Service from a location.

(5) Insurance Requirements.

Mobile Food Service Vehicles shall obtain, at a minimum, any motor vehicle
insurance required by any local, state, or federal laws and regulations.



CITY OF JACKSON Amendment #; ' 44
FY21 Budget Amendment
BUDGET ORDINANCE/AMENDMENTS

MAYOR APPROVAL DATE:
COUNCIL APPROVAL DATE: /’-“74' %M,‘ 5742,
-, L4
APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
GENERAL REVENUE
TOTAL REVENUE - - -
EXPENDITURE APPROVED BUDGET TOTAL AMENDED
Account/Description FY21 BUDGET AMENDMENT FY21 BUDGET
TORNADO SIREN -
Municipal Court Building 315-41815-900 885,622.00 {i3,469.00) 882,153.00
Emergency Management 315-52800-900 - 13,469.00 13,469.00
TOTAL EXPENDITURE 895,622.00 - 895,622.00
NOTES City portion for Madison County new tornado siren.
AMENDMENTS ENTERED BY:
AMENDMENTS ENTERED DATE:
Created Date: 4/26/2021 By: Cathy Keck

4/26/2021 10:59 AM
a




RESOLUTION

FOR THE PURPOSE OF STATING THE CITY OF JACKSON'S INTENT
TO ENDORSE THE BICYCLE, PEDESTRIAN AND GREENWAYS PLAN
UPON ITS COMPLETION

WHEREAS, the City of Jackson’s existing Bicycle and Pedestrian master plan was developed in 2005; and

WHEREAS, since that time, the City has undergone numerous Long Range Transportation Plan updates and
developed a new citywide comprehensive plan; and

WHEREAS, the development of a new Bicycle, Pedestrian and Greenways master plan will allow the City to
buitd upon the efforts of previous plans and create a livable document that can be implemented to improve the
City's existing network; and

WHEREAS, this new master plan will seek to be innovative in focusing on a multifaceted, varied modal
approach since the needs of mobility, land use, and population dictate more than just a “one size fits all” approach;
and

WHEREAS, the establishment of safe bicycle and pedestrian routes improve the health and wellness of our
local community; and

WHEREAS, the City of Jackson completed an application to the Tennessee Department of Transportation
{TDOT) for a 2020-2021 Urban Transportation Planning Grant to develop an updated Bicycle, Pedestrian and
Greenways Plan; and

WHEREAS, the City of Jackson was awarded a $200,000 Urban Transportation Planning Grant by the
Tennessee Department of Transportation {TDOT}; and

WHEREAS, TDOT will fund 90% of the grant with the City of Jackson only responsibie for 10% of the grant,
which is $17,494.00;

NOW, BE IT RESOLVED, it is the intent of the City of Jackson to endorse the Bicycle, Pedestrian and
Greenways Plan for the City of Jackson upon its completion,

Resolution duly passed on june 1, 2021,

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURES:

SCOTT CONGER, MAYOR

BOBBY ARNOLD, CITY RECORDER



City of Jackson Pension Plan
Funding Policy

Preamble

The intent of this funding policy is to establish a formal methodology for financing the pension
obligations accruing under the City of Jackson Pension Plan. The purpose of the methodology is
to ensure that current assets plus future assets from employer contributions and investment
earnings will be sufficient to finance all defined benefit pension benefits provided by City of
Jackson Pension Plan, including, but not limited to death, disability and retirement benefits. The
funding policy is intended to reflect a reasonable and fiscally conservative approach with each
generation of taxpayers financing, considering the cost of pension benefits being accrued. This
funding policy recognizes that there will be investment market place volatility and that actual
economic and demographic experience will differ from assumed experience. Accordingly, this
funding policy is intended to provide flexibility to smooth such volatility and experience ina
reasonable, systematic, and financially sound manner. Further, it is the intent that this funding
policy comply with all applicable federal and state laws, rules, and regulations.

This funding policy is being adopted by the Jackson City Council of City of Jackson in
accordance with Chapter Number 990 of the Public Acts of 2014, and also in fulfilling its
fiduciary duty. Also, Chapter Number 990 of the Public Acts of 2014 requires the City of
Jackson to develop a funding policy. Moreover, adoption of a funding policy is recommended
by the Government Finance Officers Association and the Governmental Accounting Standards
Board.

Components of this Funding Policy

1. The ADC (Actuarially Determined Contribution) for the pension plan, which shall
include the normal costs and the amortization of any unfunded accrued liability;

2. The maximum amortization period; and

3. The City of Jackson shall include at least one hundred percent (100%) funding of the
ARC (Actuarial Required Contribution) within its budget.

Actuarial Services

City of Jackson shall obtain the services of an independent, qualified actuary who shall
determine City of Jackson ADC for its defined benefit pension plan. The actuary shall be a
member of the American Academy of Actuaries, shall not be a member of City of Jackson and
shall not be otherwise eligible to participate in any of City of Jackson’s pension plans.

Actuarial Valuation

~ An actuarial valuation to determine the “Actuarially Determined Contribution (ADC)” rate to
finance pension obligations shall be performed bi-annually beginning as of Fiscal year 2021.
The valuation shall utilize the entry-age normal actuarial method or another permitted method.
The ADC shall include (1) the normal cost, (2) the unfunded liability cost, and (3) the cost of

1



administration, The ADC shall be calculated and become applicable on July 1 following the
valuation date.

An asset smoothing method shall be utilized to determine the actuarial value of assets. The
difference between the amount actually earned and the earnings assumption for a particular year
shall be amortized in level amounts. The asset smoothing period shall be a maximum of ten
(10) years; however, for any smoothing period greater than five (5) years, there shall be a
corridor so that the actuarial value of assets cannot be 20% more than nor 20% less than the
market value of assets existing as of the actuarial valuation date.

Unfunded liabilities shall be amortized utilizing the level dollar amortization method over a
closed period not to exceed 20 years.

Demographic data. The demographic data in an actuarial valuation shall include: (1) all active
members, (2) all inactive vested members, (3) all inactive non-vested members with an account
balance, and (4) all annuitants (including beneficiary annuitants and disability annuitants).
Benefit provisions. The actuarial valuation shall include all benefits being accrued by members
of (name) including, but not limited to, retirement, disability, death benefits, and post-
employment cost-of-living adjustments (COLAs). The valuation shall be based on the benefit
eligibility and benefit terms as set out in state law.

Transparency and Accountability

This funding policy and the actuarial valuation shall be readily available for review.
Accordingly, the funding policy shall be posted on the agency’s website. Further, the actuarial
valuation, and the actuarial audit shall be maintained on the departmental website for a period of
no less than five years after being published.

Filing of Funding Policy

Pursuant to Public Chapter 990, Acts of 2014, this funding policy and any amendments thereafter
shall be submitted to the comptroller of the treasury within thirty (30) days after adoption.

Effective Date

This policy shall remain in effect until amended by the City of Jackson or preefnpted by federal
or state law.

(Chair ) Date Adopted



CONTRACT
BETWEEN THE STATE OF TENNESSEE,
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
AND
CITY OF JACKSON

This Contract, by and between the State of Tennessee, Department of Transportation, hereinafter
referred to as the "State” and City of Jackson, hereinafter referred to as the “Contractor,” is for the
provision of a special agreement for mowing and litter, as further defined in the "SCOPE OF SERVICES”

Contractor Edison Registration |D # 0000001560
Contract #: CMA 2272

A. SCOPE OF SERVICES:

A.1.  The Contractor shall provide all service and deliverables as required, described, and detaited
herein and shall meet all service and delivery timelines as specified by this Contract.

A2.  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-201 provides that the State is authorized to enter into contracts with
municipalities regarding the improvement and maintenance of streets over which traffic on state
highways is routed.

A3. Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-202 provides that streets constructed, reconstructed, improved and
maintained by the State shali be of a width and type that the State deems proper, but the width so
constructed, reconstructed, improved and maintained shall not be less than eighteen feet (18");
and, in the case of resurfacing and maintenance, from curb to curb where curbs exist, or the full
width of the roadway where no curbs exist.

A4.  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-203 provides that the State is authorized to enter into contracts with
municipalities that are organized to care for streets to reimburse, subject to the approval of the
State, for improvements and maintenance.

A5.  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-16-106 provides that the highway authorities of the state, counties, cities,
and town are authorized to enter into agreements with each other respecting the improvement
and maintenance of controlled-access facilities, defined by Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-16-101 as a
highway or street specially designed for through traffic, and over, from or to which owners or
occupants of abutting land or other persons have no right or easement of access from abutting
properties.

AB,  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-139 provides that the State may enter into a contract with a qualified
county to perform maintenance activities upon the rights-of-way of state highways located outside
of municipalities and metropolitan governments; and, that the reimbursement shail be on an
actual cost basis.

A7. The State is hereby contracting with the Contractor for the improvements and maintenance
specified in Attachment “Exhibit A” titled "Guidelines Covering Maintenance of State Highways
through Municipalities,” attached and incorporated hereto as part of this Contract.

B. TERM OF CONTRACT:
This Contract shall be effective on July 1, 2021 (“Effective Date™), and extend for a period of

twelve {12) months after the Effective Date (“Term”). The State shall have no obligation for goods
or services provided by the Contractor prior to the Effective Date.




c.z2

c3.

PAYMENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Maximum Liability. In no event shall the maximum liability of the State under this Contract
exceed Seventy-one thousand Six hundred Eighty-eight and Sixty cents ($71,688.60). The
payment rates in section C.3 shall constitute the entire compensation due the Contractor for all
service and Contractor obligations hereunder regardless of the difficulty, materials or equipment
required. The payment rates include, but are not limited to, all applicable taxes, fees, overheads,
and all other direct and indirect costs incurred or to be incurred by the Contractor.

The Contractor is not entitied to be paid the maximum liabifity for any period under the Contract or
any extensions of the Contract for work not requested by the State. The maximum liability
represents available funds for payment to the Contractor and does not guarantee payment of any
such funds to the Contractor under this Contract unless the State requests work and the
Contractor performs said work. In which case, the Contractor shall be paid in accordance with
the payment rates detailed in section C.3. The State is under no obligation to request work from
the Contractor in any specific doflar amounts or to request any work at all from the Contractor
during any period of this Contract,

Compensation Firm. The payment rates and the maximum liability of the State under this
Contract are firm for the duration of the Contract and are not subject to escalation for any reason
unless amended.

Payment Methodology. The Contractor shall be compensated based on the payment rates herein
for units of service authorized by the State in a total amount not to exceed the Contract Maximum

Liability established in section C.1.

a The Contractor's compensation shall be contingent upon the satisfactory completion of
units, mitestones, or increments of service defined in section A.

b. The Contractor shall be compensated for said units, milestones, or increments of service
based upon the following payment rates:

Amount

Service Description {per compensable increment)

“Exhibit A" titled "Guidelines Covering Maintenance of State See Exhibit A

Highways through Municipalities”

C4.

C.5

Travel Compensation. The Contractor shall not be compensated or reimbursed for travel, meais,
or lodging.

Invoice Reguirements. The Contractor shall invoice the State oniy for completed increments of
service and for the amount stipulated in section C.3, above, and present said invoices no more
often than monthly, with all necessary supporting documentation, to:

TDOT District 48 Maintenance
300 Benchmark Place
Jackson, TN 38301

a, Each invoice shall clearly and accurately detail all of the following required information
(calculations must be extended and totaled correctly}.

(1) Inveice Number (assigned by the Contracter)
{2) Invoice Date
{3) Contract Number (assigned by the State)




C6.

C.7.

c.s.

ce.

4) Customer Account Name: Tennessee Department of Transportation
{5) Customer Account Number (assigned by the Contractor to the above-referenced

Customer)

(8} Contractor Name

{7) Contractor Tennessee Edison Registration ID Number Referenced in Preambie
of this Contract

{(8) Contractor Contact for Invoice Questions (name, phone, andfor fax)
{9) Contractor Remittance Address

(10}  Description of Delivered Service

(11}  Complete Itemization of Charges, which shall detail the following:

i Service or Milestone Description (including name & title as applicable) of
each service invoiced

ii. Number of Completed Units, Increments, Hours, or Days as applicable,
of each service invoiced

iii, Applicable Payment Rate (as stipulated in Section C.3.) of each service

invoiced
iv. Amount Due by Service
V. Total Amount Due for the invoice period
b. The Contractor understands and agrees that an invoice under this Contract shali:
N include only charges for service described in Contract Section A and in

accordance with payment terms and conditions set forth in Contract Section C;
{2} only be submitted for completed service and shall not include any charge for

future work;

(3} not include sales tax or shipping charges; and

4 initiate the timeframe for payment (and any discounts) only when the State is in
receipt of the invoice, and the invoice meets the minimum requirements of this
section C.5.

Payment of Invoice. A payment by the State shall not prejudice the State's right to object to or
question any payment, invoice, or matter in relation thereto. A payment by the State shall not be
construed as acceptance of any part of the wark or service provided or as approval of any
amount invoiced.

invoice Reductions. The Contractor's invoice shall be subject to reduction for amounts included

in any invoice or payment theretofore made which are determined by the State, on the basis of
audits conducted in accordance with the terms of this Contract, not to constitute proper
remuneration for compensable services.

Deductions. The State reserves the right to deduct from amounts, which are or shall become due
and payable to the Contractor under this or any contract between the Contractor and the State of
Tennessee any amounts, which are or shall become due and payable to the State of Tennessee
by the Contractor.

Prerequisite Documentation. The Contractor shali not invoice the State under this Contract until
the State has received the following documentation properly completed.

a. The Contractor shali complete, sign, and present to the State the "Authorization
Agreement for Automatic Deposit Form" provided by the State. By doing so, the
Contractor acknowiedges and agrees that, once this form is received by the State,
payments to the Contractor, under this or any other contract the Contractor has with the
State of Tennessee, may be made by ACH; and

b. The Contractor shall complete, sign, and return to the State the State-provided W-9 form,
The taxpayer identification number on the W-9 form must be the same as the
Contractor's Federal Employer Identification Nurnber or Social Security Number
referenced in the Contractor's Edison registration information.



D2

D.3.

D4,

B.5,

D.6.

D.7.

D.8.

STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Required Approvais. The State is not bound by this Contract until it is signed by the contract
parties and approved by appropriate officials in accordance with applicable Tennessee laws and
regulations (depending upon the specifics of this contract, said officials may include, but are not
limited to, the Commissioner of Finance and Administration, the Commissioner of Human
Resources, and the Comptroiler of the Treasury).

Modification and Amendment. This Contract may be modified only by a written amendment
signed by all parties hereto and approved by both the officials who approved the base contract
and, depending upon the specifics of the contract as amended, any additional officials required by
Tennessee laws and regulations (said officials may include, but are not limited to, the
Commissioner of Finance and Administration, the Commissioner of Human Resources, and the
Comptroller of the Treasury).

Termination for Convenience. The State may terminate this Contract without cause for any
reason. Said termination shall not be deemed a breach of contract by the State. The State shall
give the Contractor at least thirty (30) days written notice before the effective termination date.
The Contractor shall be entitled to compensation for satisfactory, authorized service compieted as
of the termination date, but in no event shali the State be liable to the Contractor for
compensation for any service which has not been rendered. Upon such termination, the
Contractor shall have no right to any actual general, special, incidental, consequential, or any
other damages whatsoever of any description or amount.

Termination for Cause. If the Contractor fails to properly perform its obligations under this
Contract in a timely or proper manner, or if the Contractor violates any terms of this Contract, the
State shall have the right to immediately terminate the Contract and withheld payments in excess
of fair compensation for completed services. Notwithstanding the above, the Contractor shail not
be relieved of liability to the State for damages sustainad by virtue of any breach of this Contract
by the Contractor.

Subcontracting. The Contractor shall not assign this Contract or enter into a subcontract for any
of the services performed under this Contract without abtaining the prior written approval of the
State. If such subcontracts are approved by the State, each shall contain, at a minimum, sections
of this Contract below pertaining to "Conflicts of Interest,” "Nondiscrimination," and "Records” (as
identified by the section headings). Notwithstanding any use of approved subcontractors, the
Contractor shall be the prime contractor and shali be responsible for ali work performed.

Conflicts of Interest. The Contractor warrants that no part of the total Contract Amount shall be
paid directly or indirectly to an employee or official of the State of Tennessee as wages,
compensation, or gifts in exchange for acting as an officer, agent, employee, subcontractor, or
consultant to the Contractor in connection with any work contemplated or performed relative to
this Contract.

Nondiscrimination. The Contractor hereby agrees, warrants, and assures that no person shall be
exciuded from participation in, be denied henefits of, or be otherwise subjected to discrimination
in the performance of this Contract or in the employment practices of the Contractor on the
grounds of handicap or disability, age, race, color, religion, sex, national origin, or any other
classification protected by Federal, Tennessee State constitutional, or statutory law. The
Contractor shail, upon request, show proof of such nondiscrimination and shail post in
conspicuous places, available to all employees and applicants, notices of nondiscrimination.

Records. The Contractor shall maintain documentation for ali charges under this Contract. The
books, records, and documents of the Contractor, insofar as they relate to work performed or
money received under this Contract, shall be maintained for a period of three (3) full years from
the date of the final payment and shall be subject to audit at any reasonable time and upon
reasonable notice by the State, the Comptroller of the Treasury, or their duly appointed
representatives. The financial statements shall be prepared in accordance with generally
accepted accounting principles.



D9

D.10.

D.11.

D12

D.13.

D.14.
D.15.

D.16.

D.17.

P.18.

D.18.

Prevailing Wage Rates. All contracts for construction, erection, or demolition or to install goods
or materials that involve the expenditure of any funds derived from the State require compliance
with the prevailing wage laws as provided in Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 12-4-401 et
seq..

Monitoring. The Contractor's activities conducted and records maintained pursuant to this
Contract shall be subject to monitoring and evaluation by the State, the Comptroller of the
Treastiry, or their duly appointed representatives.

Progress Reports. The Contractor shall submit brief, periodic, progress reports to the State as
requested.

Strict Performance. Failure by any party to this Contract to insist in any one or more cases upon
the strict performance of any of the terms, covenants, conditions, or provisions of this Contract
shall not be construed as a waiver or relinquishment of any such term, covenant, condition, or
provision. No term or condition of this Contract shail be held to be waived, modified, or deleted
except by a written amendment signed by the parties hereto.

Independent Contractor. The parties hereto, in the performance of this Contract, shall not act as
employees, partners, joint venturers, or associates of one another. It is expressly acknowledged
by the parties hereto that such parties are independent contracting entities and that nothing in this
Contract shall be construed to create a employerfemployee relationship or to allow either to
exercise control or direction over the manner or method by which the other transacts its business
affairs or provides its usua! services. The employees or agents of one party shall not be deemed
or construed to be the employees or agents of the other party for any purpose whatsoever.

The Contractor, being a Tennessee governmental entity, is governed by the provisions of the
Tennessee Government Tort Liability Act, Tennessee Code Annotated, Sections 29-20-101 et
seq., for causes of action sounding in tort. Further, no contract provision requiring a Tennessee
political entity to indemnify or hold harmless the State beyond the liability imposed by law is
enforceable because it appropriates public money and nullifies governmental immunity without
the authorization of the General Assembly.

State Liability. The State shall have no liability except as specifically provided in this Contract.
Force Majeure. The obligations of the parties to this Contract are subject to prevention by causes

beyond the parties’ control that could not be avoided by the exercise of due care including, but
not fimited to, natural disasters, riots, wars, epidemics, or any other similar cause.

State and Federal Compliance. The Contractor shall comply with ali applicable State and Federal

laws and reguiations in the performance of this Contract.

Governing Law. This Contract shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws
of the State of Tennessee. The Contractor agrees that it will be subject to the exclusive
jurisdiction of the courts of the State of Tennessee in actions that may arise under this Contract.
The Contractor acknowledges and agrees that any rights or claims against the State of
Tennessee or its employees hereunder, and any remedies arising therefrom, shall be subject to
and limited to those rights and remedies, if any, available under Tennessee Code Annotated,
Sections 9-8-101 through 9-8-407.

Completeness. This Contract is complete and contains the entire understanding between the
parties relating to the subject matter contained herein, including all the terms and conditions of
the parties’ agreement. This Contract supersedes any and all prior understandings,
representations, negotiations, and agreements between the parties relating hereto, whether
written or oral.

Severability. If any terms and conditions of this Contract are held to be invalid or unenforceable
as a matter of law, the other terms and conditions hereof shall not be affected thereby and shail



D.20.

EZ

E3.

E4.

E. 5.

remain in full force and effect. To this end, the terms and conditions of this Contract are declared
severable.

Headings. Section headings of this Contract are for reference purposes only and shall not be
construed as part of this Contract.

SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Conflicting Terms and Conditions. Should any of these special terms and conditions conflict with
any other terms and conditions of this Contract, these special terms and conditions shall control.

Communications and Contacts. All instructions, notices, consents, demands, or other
communications required or contemplated by this Contract shall be in writing and shall be made
by certified, first class mail, return receipt requested and postage prepaid, by overnight courier
service with an asset tracking system, or by EMAIL or facsimile transmission with recipient
confirmation. Any such communications, regardless of method of transmission, shall be
addressed to the respective party at the appropriate mailing address, facsimile number, or EMAIL
address as set forth below or to that of such cther party or address, as may be hereafter specified
by written notice.

The State:

Burton Hatch, Operations District Supervisor

State of Tennessee, Department of Transportation
300 Benchmark Place

Jackson, TN 38301

burton.hatch@tn.gov

Telephone # 731-935-0281 FAX # 731-935-0282

The Confractor;

City of Jackson

121 East Main St.

Linda Reaves
Ireaves@cityofiackson.net
Telephone # 731-425-8541

All instructions, notices, consents, demands, or other communications shall be considered
effectively given upon receipt or recipient confirmation as may be required.

Subject to Funds Availability. The Contract is subject to the appropriation and availability of State
andfor Federal funds. In the event that the funds are not appropriated or are otherwise
unavailable, the State reserves the right to terminate the Contract upon written notice to the
Contractor. Said termination shall not be deemed a breach of Contract by the State. Upon
receipt of the written notice, the Contractor shall cease all work associated with the Contract.
Should such an event occur, the Contractor shall be entitled to compensation for all satisfactory
and authorized services completed as of the termination date. Upon such termination, the
Contractor shall have no right to recover from the State any actual, general, special, incidental,
consequential, or any other damages whatsoever of any description or amount.

MUTCD. In accordance with Tenn, Code Ann. 54-5-108, the Contractor shall conform to and act
in accordance with the current edition of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD)
as adopted by rules of the State. Particularly, the Contractor shall sign work-zones associated
with this Contract in accordance with the aforesaid MUTCD.

Maintenance. Nothing contained in this Contract shall change the maintenance obligations
governed by the laws of the State of Tennessee, it being the intent of this Contract not to enlarge
the present maintenance obligations of the State.



IN WITNESS WHEREOF,

CITY OF JACKSON:

CONTRACTOR SIGNATURE DATE

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF CONTRACTOR SIGNATORY (above)

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY

CONTRACTOR ATTORNEY SIGNATURE DATE

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF CONTRACTOR ATTORNEY SIGNATORY (above)

STATE OF TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION:

CLAY BRIGHT, COMMISSIONER DATE

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY

JOHN REINBOLD, GENERAL COUNSEL PATE



Rev. 03-17-2021

“EXHIBIT A”

GUIDELINES COVERING MAINTENANCE

Page 1 of 6

OF STATE HIGHWAYS THROUGH MUNICIPALITIES

The following items where applicable are eligible for reimbursement by the State to the Contractor under the Special Maintenance

Agreement:
Activity Maintenance Work Type Unit Of Measure
435 Machine Mowing** Acres
441 Litter Removal*™* Roadway Miles

** Work must be inside the area eligible for reimbursements as detalted in "CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS",

Machine Mowing work shall consist of cutting or trimming vegetation primarily consisting of, but not limited to, grasses and invasive
weeds on State rights-of-way as detailed below to provide a consistent and aesthetically pleasing standing vegetation height as

directed by the State.

Litter Removal Work shall consist of removal of litter from the entire highway rights-of-way where accessible {fence to fence where
applicable), including shoulders and excluding the travel fanes on interstate and state routes as detailed below.

Mechanical Sweeping and Street Flushing work shall consist of the removai by mechanical sweeping, or othet approved means, of dirt
and debris accumulated on the roadway along cuibs, guttets, median barriers, bridge curbs and gore areas and ramps at interchanges as

detailed below.



V 1l19IHXd

80°1021 :(sa1oe) BOLY JOBIJUOY |BJOL
80°0.¢C 9 LO'Sk 06'Ly LL'E 082 0S¥ Ve o8l
06891 9 Gl'8¢ Gl'8¢C | oSV c9'¢C ve| 98l
¢l vee 9 ¢06E Le'ee LL°S Go'¢c 000 e o8L
00'82S 9 0088 0088 loo'eg 0008 ve| Ol
[EETRT) s312A9 (sa4oe) (sai2e) ey (sa12e) (W)uwaag pug (W) uia] uibag adAL JaquinN
BalY |EJOL Buimop BalY [B]JO] |SS292Y pajjoiluos | ealy URIpap Aempeoy | 9noy
juawbag Jo JaquinN uswbag
JoRIUCH
JoOUSHIOAA AIOJUBAL| [ UIMON

9 jo 7 93eg

09°810'¥S$

((Buimopy) JuswasInquiey WNWIXEN PaleN2|eD
210y Jod uswssinquisy Buimop psaciddy

00°S¥$

*MO[2q pajielap se a1oe Jad 2oLid 2 pue s9[949 JO JaqUINu Sy} P232X2 01 10U ‘TULMOU SUIYdewW Jof papuadxa A|[enIoe JUNOWe ay; ul 1030B.[U0D)
ples 3sinquisi 0] $3215e a1Bl§ AU ], “I9BNUOD 1Y JO SULID] ) J9PUN I0J0BNUOY) 313 AQ PSUIBIUIBUL 3q [[IM YIIYMm SIIIE Ul Bare Suimow 3|qiS12 ay) saziway 3|qe], Sulmo[jo) ay |,

STILITVAIDINNN HONOYHL SAVMHDIH 3LVLS 40

AONVNALNIVIA FHL 404 ONIMOW INIHOVIN 3T14d1D1Td 40 AYOLNIANI

120¢T-

L1-£0 "AsY



V LIdIHXd

00°0¥9.1 08'25¢ :("w) JopI oesuUoY [ejoL
00°0¥65S 08'8lLlL cl 000 $ (066 € 0€'¢ 08, (14 Ye 981
00°0cEe 0999 Zl 0005 $|SSS € S8l 0S¢ 69T Ye| 98l
00°0L.% 0¥°'G6 cl 0005 ¢ |S6°2 € G9'¢ g9'¢C 000 YZ| 98l
00°009¢ 00¢L Zl 000 ¢ (009 € A DO B 0028 00708 Y| Ol
($)somegor| (w) sai2ho | apwdam | (rw) wawbag | (‘1w)wybuaq () wiua), Buipuz () Jujuaay, Buluuibag adA] | Jaqunp
juswbag |iomiiejol | Jeapi1jo | Jad asug Jani lad s3I juawbag Aempeoy | anoy
JoBJUOYD wewbag | Jaqunp 2101 ssed Japi
19BHUOD uawbag
199U SHJOAA AJOJUBAL] JPIT]
000v9'ZL ¢ :(J21M) JuswesINquisy WNWXB pajeinde)
00°06% ‘9w Jad uswssnguuisy Jap panosddy

9Jo g 33eq

*M0[2q pajielsp se a[iw reaul| 1ad 35Lid U} pue S9[9AD JO ISQUINU A} PISIXS 0} JOU “[BAOWAL JONI| 10J papuadxa AJ[enioe Junoure i ul JOJPB[UOY) PIes 9SINGUIaI
01 53213 31B)S Sy, “JOBRNUOD SIY} JO SULIA] BYf) JIPUN JOJOBIUOD) Y AQ PAUIBIUIBUI 3q [[IA UYDIYM SS[IUI JE3UL| Ul [BAOWA1 JaRI| JO YSua] 2[qISI[a Sy} SSZIWSY S[qe], SuImo[[o) Sy L

SHILI'TVAIDINNW HDNOYHL SAVMHOIH d1LVLS 40
HONVNILNIVIN HHL 4904 TYAOWTY YALLIT 371919173 40 AYOLNIANI

1T0T-L1-€0 "AY




Rev. 03-17-2021

EXHIBIT A

Page 4 of 6
CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS

ROADWAY
ELIGLBLE FOR REIMBURSEMENTS
Pavad Surface Pgved Surface
F ‘q\ FIGURE 1A
.l__ R |

NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED
UNDIVIDED ROADWAY

ROADWAY
ELIGIBLE FOR RE IMBURSEMENTS
Pavaed Surface Pavad Surface
e — FIGURE 18
— NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED T

UNDIVIDED ROADWAY

ROADWAY
ELIGIDLE FOR REIMBURSEMENTS

Snoulder] Pavad Surface Poved Surfoce  |Sheuldar

l N'\ FIGURE 1C
\///k NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED .

UNDEVIDED RQADWAY
WITHOUT CURB

NOTE + IN FIGURES 1A, IB, AND 1C FOR NON-CONTROLLED ROUTES
THE PAVED SURFACE WILL INCLUDE PAVED SHOULDERS.

ROADRAY
ELIGIBLE FOR REIMBURSEMENTS

Paved Surface Paved Surfoce

E,__‘f —E FIGURE 1D

NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED
UNDIVIDED ROADWAY
WiTH CURB

ROADRAY
ELIGIBLE FOR REIMBURSEMENTS

Pavaed Surfoce Paved Sur face

£

————

Arga Ellglble for
Mrwing ond Litter
Ra trbur semant

Ef NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED -
DIVIDED ROADWAY

WITH CURB

FIGURE IE




Page 5 of 6

Rev, (03-17-2021

CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS

91 3¥NI13

41 34¥Noi4

*SY3CNOHS G3AVd 3AMIINI TT1M Jov3dns Q3Avd 3HL
$31N0Y¥ G3T0MINCD SS3JIV-NON H0J 31 ONv 41 S3u¥ADTS 4

BYND LNOHLIA AVAOYOM Q30IAIQ
Q37I08LNOD S53J7V-NON

N

F310N

S~

SUSUIBT NG ) @Y
493117 pue Dujaow
404 91916513 pasy

B30 %, DALY

NYE(F3N HLO IR 3T8VIHYA

Go04 NG DEADY

SLNZH3ISHNENI3Y ¥04 3T8ISTT3
A¥ROvoY

guN) HilM AVROVOY G30IAIQ
0371704.LNOD $5330V-NON

4 SUSLORINGH | OM
404417 pup Bujaon
203 01qi01 13 oIy

BODLING PRADY

..ﬂxnwn_ "G
"RY103M HLOIH TIEVINVA

004G POALS

SININISHNEAT 3d 80§ 37933173
AVRGTOH

EXHIBIT A




Page 6 of 6

Rev. 03-17-2021

CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS

gZ 3dNaid
Q30IAIONN
$$303v Q3 TTIOULNDD \/
Lm0 \\ 1AL
AVA-I0-LHDEY — AVH-3Q-ERDIM
¥ / \ %0
avoy avoy
39V AINOY I l | ERL AN R ]
¥0 =T 004N DOADG Q0D NG POADG BO04 NG PEADY T I05 [PouS ¥0
dINTI FINFS
5SSV £53J0v
G37708LND3D G37104LNOD
SININISUABNIIY 803 3BIDIT3
AYROYOH
¥Z 380214
NYI1O03W HLIM
SS320¥ G3TIOMINOD
LIKLT
AVR=-30-1HO[H LR
%0 AVA-A0-LHIIH
" ) au:mﬁ _.3 i
avoy JapintuS | SR0)aNS PRADd M5 a50; NG DBADG  J8D1NOuS ¥E
JDVINOYS NYIO3A 4LOIM 378vI4vA avou
HO IOVINDHA
<S55y .
FIN3S
03717041800 g
2370M1NOD

SINIRISENBAT Y 03 37812113
AVAOVOY

EXHIBIT A




|
|

CONTRACT
BETWEEN THE STATE OF TENNESSEE,
DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
AND
CITY OF JACKSON

This Contract, by and between the State of Tennessee, Department of Transportation, hereinafter
referred to as the ‘State” and City of Jackson, hereinafter referred to as the "Cantractar,” is for the
provision of the routine maintenance of state routes, as further defined in the "SCOPE OF SERVICES."

Contractor Edison Registration 1D # 0000001560
Contract #: CMA 2273

A. SCOPE OF SERVICES:

A1, The Contractor shall provide all service and deliverables as required, described, and detailed
herein and shall meet ali service and delivery timelines as specified by this Contract.

A2. Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-201 provides that the State is authorized to enter into contracts with
municipalities regarding the improvement and maintenance of streets over which traffic on state
highways is routed.

A3.  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-202 provides that streets constructed, reconstructed, improved and
maintained by the State shall be of a width and type that the State deems proper, but the width so
constructed, reconstructed, improved and maintained shall not be less than eighteen feet (18");
and, in the case of resurfacing and maintenance, from curb to curb where curbs exist, or the full
width of the roadway where no curbs exist.

A4,  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-203 provides that the State is authorized to enter into contracts with
municipalities that are organized to care for streets to reimburse, subject to the approval of the
State, for improvements and maintenance.

A.5.  Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-16-106 provides that the highway authorities of the state, counties, cities,
and town are authorized to enter into agreements with each other respecting the improvement
and maintenance of controlled-access facllities, defined by Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-16-101 as a
highway or street specially designed for through traffic, and over, from or to which cwners or
occupants of abutting land or other persons have no right or easement of access from abutting
properties.

AB Tenn. Code Ann. § 54-5-139 provides that the State may enter into a contract with a qualified
county to perform maintenance activities upon the rights-of-way of state highways located outside
of municipalities and metropolitan governments; and, that the reimbursement shall be on an
actual cost basis.

A7.  The State is hereby contracting with the Contractor for the improvements and maintenance
specified in Attachment “Exhibit A” fitled "Guidelines Covering Maintenance of State Highways
through Municipalities”, attached and incorporated hereto as part of this Contract,

B.  TERM OF CONTRACT:
This Contract shall be effective on July 1, 2021 ("Effective Date”), and extend for a period of

twelve (12) months after the Effective Date (“Term"). The State shall have no obligation for goods
or services provided by the Contractor prior to the Effective Date.



C.z2

c3

PAYMENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Maximum Liability. In no event shall the maximum lfability of the State under this Contract
exceed One Hundred Seventy-Five thousand and One Hundred Seventeen Dollars and Five
Cents ($175,117.05). The payment rates in section C.3 shail constitute the entire compensation
due the Contractor for ail service and Contractor obligations hereunder regardless of the difficulty,
materials or equipment required. The payment rates inciude, but are not limited to, all applicable
taxes, fees, overheads, and all other direct and indirect costs incurred or to be incurred by the
Contractor.

The Contractor is not entitled to be paid the maximum jiability for any period under the Contract or
any extensions of the Contract for work not requested by the State. The maximum liability
represents available funds for payment to the Contractor and does not guarantee payment of any
such funds to the Contractor under this Contract uniess the State requests work and the
Contractor performs said work. In which case, the Contractor shall be paid in accordance with
the payment rates detailed in section C.3. The State is under no abligation to request work from
the Contractor in any specific dollar amounts or to request any work at all from the Contractor
during any period of this Contract.

Compensation Firm. The payment rates and the maximum liability of the State under this
Contract are firm for the duration of the Contract and are not subject to escalation for any reason

unless amended.

Payment Methodology. The Contractor shall be compensated based on the payment rates herein
for units of service authorized by the State in a total amount not to exceed the Contract Maximum
Liability established in section C.1.

a. The Contractor's compensation shall be contingent upon the satisfactory completion of
units, milestones, or increments of service defined in section A.

b. The Coniractor shall be compensated for said units, milestones, or increments of service
based upon the following payment rates:

Amount

Service Description {per compensable increment)

"Exhibit A" titled "Guidelines Covering Maintenance of State See Exhibit A

Highways through Municipalities”

If included hergin “Exhibit B” containing the maximum allowable See Exhibit B

tabor and equipment rates.

C4

C.b.

Travel Compensation. The Contractor shail not be compensated or reimbursed for travel, meals,
or lodging.

Invoice Requirements. The Contractor shall invoice the State only for completed increments of
service and for the amount stipulated in section C.3, above, and present said invoices no more
often than monthly, with all necessary supporting documentation, to:

TDOT District 48 Maintenance

300 Benchmark Place
Jackson, TN 38301

8, Each invoice shall clearly and accurately detail all of the following required information
(calculations must be extended and totaled corractly).

{1 inveice Number {assigned by the Contractar)




C.6.

C.7

c.8.

c.e.

2) Invoice Date
(3) Contract Number {assigned by the State}

{4) Customer Account Name: Tennessee Depariment of Transportation
(5) Customer Account Number (assigned by the Contractar to the above-referenced
Customer)

(B) Contractor Name

{7 Contractor Tennessee Edison Registration |D Number Referenced in Preamble
of this Contract

(8) Contractor Contact for Invoice Questions (name, phone, and/or fax)

(9) Contractor Remittance Address

(10)  Description of Delivered Service

(11)  Complete Itemization of Charges, which shall detail the following:

i. Service or Milestone Description (including name & title as applicable) of
each service invoiced

if. Number of Completed Units, Increments, Hours, or Days as applicable,
of each service invoiced

lid. Applicable Payment Rate (as stipulated in Section C.3.) of each service

invoiced
v, Amount Due by Service
V. Totai Amount Due for the invoice period
b. The Contractor understands and agrees that an invoice under this Contract shall:

{t) include only charges for service described in Contract Section A and in
accordance with payment terms and conditions set forth in Contract Section C;

(2) only be submitted for completed service and shall not include any charge for
future work;

(3) not include sales tax or shipping charges; and

4) initiate the timeframe for payment (and any discounts} only when the State is in
recelpt of the invoice, and the invoice meets the minimum requirements of this
section C.5.

Payment of Invoice. A payment by the State shali not prejudice the State's right to object to or
question any payment, invoice, or matter in relation thereto. A payment by the State shali not be
construed as acceptance of any part of the work or service provided or as approval of any
amount invoiced.

lovoice Reductions. The Contractor's invoice shall be subject to reduction for amounts included
in any invoice or payment theretofore made which are determined by the State, on the basis of
audits conducted in accordance with the terms of this Coniract, not to constitute proper
remuneration for compensable services.

Deductions. The State reserves the right to deduct from amounts, which are or shall become due
and payable to the Contractor under this or any contract between the Contractor and the State of
Tennessee any amounts, which are or shall become due and payable to the State of Tennessee
by the Contractor.

Prerequisite Documentation. The Contractor shall not invoice the State under this Contract until
the State has received the following documentation properly completed.

a The Contractor shaill complete, sign, and present to the State the "Authorization
Agreement for Automatic DBeposit Form" provided by the State. By doing so, the
Contractor acknowledges and agrees that, once this form is received by the State,
payments to the Contractor, under this or any other contract the Contractor has with the
State of Tennessee, may be made by ACH; and

b, The Contractor shall comptete, sign, and return to the State the State-provided W-9 form.
The taxpayer identification number on the W-9 form must be the same as the



D.2.

D.3.

D.4.

D.5.

D86

D.7.

D.8.

Contractor's Federal Employer Identification Number or Social Security Number
referenced in the Contractor's Edison registration information.

STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Required Approvals. The State is not bound by this Contract until it Is signed by the contract
parties and approved by appropriate officlals in accordance with applicable Tennessee laws and
regulations (depending upon the specifics of this contract, said officials may include, but are not
limited to, the Commissioner of Finance and Administration, the Commissioner of Human
Resources, and the Comptroller of the Treasury).

Modification_and Amendment. This Contract may be modified only by a written amendment
signed by all parties hereto and approved by both the officials who approved the base contract
and, depending upon the specifics of the contract as amended, any additional officials required by
Tennessee laws and regulations (said officials may include, but are not limited to, the
Commissioner of Finance and Administration, the Commissioner of Human Resources, and the
Comptroller of the Treasury).

Termination for Convenience. The State may terminate this Contract without cause for any
reason. Said termination shall not be deemed a breach of contract by the State. The State shall
give the Contractor at least thirty (30) days written notice before the effective termination date.
The Contractor shall be entitled to compensation for satisfactory, authorized service completed as
of the termination date, but in no event shail the State be liable to the Contractor for
compensation for any service which has not been rendered. Upon such termination, the
Contractor shall have no right to any actual general, special, incidental, consequential, or any
other damages whatssever of any description or amount.

Termination for Cause. if the Contractor fails to properly perform its obligations under this
Contract in a timely or proper manner, or if the Contractor violates any terms of this Contract, the
State shall have the right to immediately terminate the Contract and withhold payments in excess
of fair compensation for completed services. Notwithstanding the above, the Contractor shall not
be relieved of liability fo the State for damages sustained by virtue of any breach of this Contract
by the Contractor.

Subcontracting. The Contractor shall not assign this Contract or enter into a subcontract for any
of the services performed under this Contract without obtaining the prior written approval of the
State. If such subcontracts are approved by the State, each shafl contain, at a minimum, sections
of this Contract below pertaining to "Conflicts of Interest," "Nondiscrimination," and “Records” (as
identified by the section headings). Notwithstanding any use of approved subcontractors, the
Contractor shall be the prime contractor and shall be responsible for all work performed.

Conflicts of Interest. The Contractor warrants that no part of the total Contract Amount shali be
paid directly or indirectly to an employee or official of the State of Tennessee as wages,
compensation, or gifts in exchange for acting as an officer, agent, employee, subcontractor, or
consultant to the Contractor in connection with any work contemplated or performed relative to
this Contract.

Nondiscrimination. The Contractor hereby agrees, warrants, and assures that no person shall be
excluded from participation in, be denied benefits of, or be otherwise subjected to discrimination
in the performance of this Contract or in the employment practices of the Contractor on the
grounds of handicap or disability, age, race, color, religion, sex, national origin, or any other
classification protected by Federal, Tennessee State constitutional, or statutory law. The
Contractor shall, upon request, show proof of such nondiscrimination and shall postin
conspicuous places, available to all employees and applicants, notices of nondiscrimination.

Records. The Contractor shall maintain documentation for ali charges under this Contract. The
books, records, and documents of the Contractor, Insofar as they relate to work performed or
money received under this Contract, shall be maintained for a period of three (3) full years from
the date of the final payment and shall be subject to audit at any reasonable time and upon



Do

0.10.

D.11.

D12

D13,

D.14.

b.15.

D.16.

D17,

D.18.

reasonable notice by the State, the Comptroller of the Treasury, or their duly appointed
representatives. The financial statements shalt be prepared in accordance with generally
accepted accounting principles.

Prevailing Wage Rates. All contracts for construction, erection, or demolition or to install goods
or materials that involve the expenditure of any funds derived from the State require compliance
with the prevailing wage laws as provided in Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 12-4-401 et

seq..

Monitoring. The Contractor's activities conducted and records maintained pursuant to this
Contract shall be subject to monitering and evaluation by the State, the Comptroller of the
Treasury, or their duly appointed representatives.

Progress Reports. The Contractor shali submit brief, periodic, progress reports to the State as
requested.

Strict Performance. Failure by any party fo this Coniract to insist in any one or more cases upon
the strict performance of any of the terms, covenants, conditions, or provisions of this Contract
shall not be construed as a waiver or relinguishment of any such ferm, covenant, condition, or
provision. No term or condition of this Contract shall be held to be waived, modified, or deleted
except by a written amendment signed by the parties hereto.

Independent Contractor. The parties hereto, in the performance of this Contract, shall not act as
employees, partners, joint venturers, or associates of one another. It is expressly acknowledged
by the parties hereto that such parties are independent contracting entities and that nothing in this
Contract shall be construed to create a employer/femployee refationship or to allow either to
exercise control or direction over the manner or method by which the other transacts its business
affairs or provides its usual services. The employees or agents of one party shali not be deemed
or construed to be the employees or agents of the other parfy for any purpose whatsoever,

The Contractor, being a Tennessee governmental entity, is governed by the provisions of the
Tennessee Government Tort Liability Act, Tennessee Code Annotated, Sections 29-20-101 et
seq., for causes of action sounding in tort. Further, no contract provision requiring a Tennessee
poiitical entity to indemnify or hold harmless the State beyond the liability imposed by law is
enforceable because it appropriates public money and nullifies governmental immunity without
the authorization of the General Assembly.

State Liabllity. The State shall have no liability except as specifically provided in this Contract.
Force Majeure. The obligations of the parties to this Contract are subject to prevention by causes
beyond the parties’ control that could not be avoided by the exercise of due care including, but
not limited to, natural disasters, riots, wars, epidemics, or any other similar cause.

State and Federal Compliance. The Contractor shall comply with ail applicable State and Federal
laws and reguiations in the performance of this Contract.

Governing Law. This Contract shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws
of the State of Tennessee. The Contractor agrees that it will be subject to the exclusive
jurisdiction of the courts of the State of Tennessee in actions that may arise under this Contract.
The Contractor acknowledges and agrees that any rights or claims against the State of
Tennessee or its employees hereunder, and any remedies arising therefrom, shall be subject to
and limited to those rights and remedies, if any, available under Tennessee Code Annolated,
Sections 9-8-101 through 9-8-407.

Completeness. This Contract is complete and contains the entire understanding between the
parties relating to the subject matter contained herein, including all the terms and conditions of
the parties’ agreement. This Contract supersedes any and all prior understandings,
representations, negotiations, and agreements between the parties relating hereto, whether
written or oral.



D.19,

D.20.

E.2

E.3.

E.A4.

E. 5.

Severability. If any terms and conditions of this Contract are held to be invalid or unenforceable
as a matter of law, the other terms and conditions hereof shall not be affected thereby and shall
remain in full force and effect. To this end, the terms and conditions of this Contract are declared
severable.

Headings. Section headings of this Contract are for reference purposes only and shall not be
construed as part of this Contract.

SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

Conflicting Terms and Conditions. Should any of these special terms and conditions conflict with
any other terms and conditions of this Contract, these special terms and conditions shail control.

Communications and Contacts. All instructions, notices, consents, demands, or other
communications required or contemplated by this Contract shall be in writing and shall be made
by certified, first class mail, return receipt requested and postage prepaid, by overnight courier
service with an asset tracking system, or by EMAIL or facsimile transmission with recipient
confirmation. Any such communications, regardiess of method of transmission, shall be
addressed to the respective party at the appropriate mailing address, facsimile number, or EMAIL
address as set forth below or to that of such other party or address, as may be hereafter specified
by written notice.

The State:

Burton Hatch, Operations District Supervisor

State of Tennessee, Department of Transportation
300 Benchmark Place

Jackson, TN 38301

burton.hatch@tn.gov

Telephone # 731-935-0281 FAX # 731-935-0282

The Contractor:

City of Jackson

121 East Main St.

Linda Reaves
reaves@cityofiackson.net
Telephone # 731-425-8541

All instructions, notices, consents, demands, or other communications shail be considered
effectively given upon receipt or recipient confirmation as may be required.

Subject to Funds Availability. The Contract is subject to the appropriation and availability of State
and/or Federal funds. In the event that the funds are not appropriated or are otherwise
unavailable, the State reserves the right to terminate the Contract upon written notice to the
Contractor. Said termination shall not be deemed a breach of Contract by the State. Upon
receipt of the written notice, the Contractor shall cease all work associated with the Contract.
Should such an event occur, the Contractor shall be entitled to compensation for all satisfactory
and authorized services completed as of the termination date. Upon such termination, the
Contractor shall have no right to recover from the State any actual, general, special, incidental,
consequential, or any other damages whatsoever of any description or amount.

MUTCD. In accordance with Tenn. Code Ann. 54-5-108, the Contractor shall conform to and act
in accordance with the current edition of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Controt Devices (MUTCD)
as adopted by rules of the State. Particularly, the Contractor shall sign work-zones associated
with this Contract in accordance with the aforesaid MUTCD.

Maintenance. Nothing contained in this Contract shail change the maintenance obligations
governed by the laws of the State of Tennesseg, it being the intent of this Contract not to enlarge
the present maintenance obligations of the State.



IN WITNESS WHEREQF,

CITY OF JACKSON:

CONTRACTOR SIGNATURE DATE

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF CONTRACTOR SIGNATORY (above)

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY

CONTRACTOR ATTORNEY SIGNATURE DATE

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF CONTRACTOR ATTORNEY SIGNATORY {above)

STATE OF TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION:

CLAY BRIGHT, COMMISSIONER DATE

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY

JOHN REINBOLD, GENERAL COUNSEL DATE



Rev. 03-17-2021

“EXHIBIT A”

GUIDELINES COVERING MAINTENANCE

OF STATE HIGHWAYS THROUGH MUNICIPALITIES

Page 1 of 8

The following items where applicable are eligible for reimbursement by the State to the Contractor under the Standard Maintenance

Agreement:
Activity Maintenance Work Type Unit Of Measure

401 Manual Spot Patching Tons
402 Crack Repair Pounds
404 Mechanical Continuous Patching Tons
405 Milling Square Yards
406 Surface Replacement Tons
411 Concrete Pavement Repair Cubic Yards
412 Concrete Joint Repair Linear Feet
425 Grading Unpaved Surface (Shoulder)** Linear Miles
427 Patching Unpaved Surface (Shoulder)** Tons
435 Machine Mowing™* Acres
438 Debris Removal** Man Hours
441 Litter Removal™* Roadway Miles
446 Mechanical Sweeping and Street Flushing Miles
447 Manual Roadway Sweeping Man Hours
460 Plowing Snow Lane Miles
461 De-icing Salt and/or Sand for Snow & lce Removal | Tons
463 Anti-icing (Salt Brine) Gallons
470 Pavement Markings Line Miles
471 Specialty Markings Each

** Work must be inside the area eligible for reimbursements as detalled in "CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS",

The following items are the responsibility of the Contractor and are not eligible for reimbursement by the State:

b

controlied.

Mowing right-of-way back of curbs or beyond edge of paved surface on roadway segments which are not access controlled.
Litter from right-of-way back of curbs or beyond edge of paved surface on roadway segments which are not access

NS e W

NOTE:

Storm drainage

Traffic control signs and signals and any other traffic control or monitoring devices.

Street lighting

Street name signs

Tree removal and vegetation control on right-of-way back of curbs or beyond edge of paved surface on roadway segments

which are not access controiled.
Sidewalks

Major resurfacing when generally required will be performed by the State as a construction project, in accordance with a
program developed after consultation with the Contractor,

The State will fumnish and maintain route markers through the Municipalities.



V L19IHXH

8§30 728

£8'6 ON al puelybiH ' aN3 ‘Am Jenjod (gt
09586 0 g5 1'agl £96 g6 oN At} ¢ ¥S oo X3 ABwNd | IONYHD "AMH Jealiog gl
00’7851 0 St 89i¢ 26 26 oN 31 [suS oo g Alepucdag]  LJIHS "AMH 1ealiog 21
09'SHIT 0 TS 989 ¥.6 196 oN ot 1quUInD | IONVYHD AN JBAJOE 8L
08'9€0.LL 0 2 8859 196 +'8 ON vl aguospnH| N3G “AMH Jeaog (gL
SC'61 oN ]! "3 "Amid YHON an3 1S BUSNUM ||
LO'S19L 0 Z€ 8 0¥y g6l 6¥'8l ON ol " Spreudld ] ISNVHO 1S IlBUaMUpA | |
LOVIvE 0 G6 9'/68 6¥'8l Zegl ON fe]! 1S euun] LJIHS g Mbup 374 1Qj)L
I¥SLLL6 9'9661E 12 55 969001 |28l £91 ON dl agqwbup 3 471a]  LJHS 18 18isayn 3L
£L'SOPPT 1] 59 TBLEE g9l 99'G| ON al jgelayo 3| 1JHS 15 aiowedfs |y
LDEEOT] 0 26 22lEL 99'Gl 'Sl ON a. 1s alowedhg|  13HS PAIE SAeMItY | |
19yI8re 0 08 ¥'86.2 'Sl 8%l ON 24 BUissomn peojiey | IONVHD pAIG sAeMIY ||
Q7 G661 09'6260L  [€T 24 8'9./2¢ 28¥L 90'F ) ON o1 18 D [ ADNYHD pAIE SAEMIY |}
0’22601 0c00 01 ¥ 056 90l 89t ON o] ssedAg Gyl | 4IHS pAIg SABMITY | |
00'ZE00L Q0 0r9Z Ge 04 ¥ 056 89l LEL ON 91| "py uone)s waWadxd | IONVYHD PN Shemily | L
00 ¥PB02 000919 G2 09 9LLET LE) €l OoN oL AY 199 paxyod 4 S|FDNVHD png shemily | L
00'g/eg) 00'0Z5¢ T4 0L 22921 8z ¢l #0°CL ON o1 |eusised | IONVHD PAG SABMIIY ||
00 0gge CLEEBT 14 08 9601 y0EL XA ON ol 2Bpug %9213 SY9H | IONVHI EESETD
00'9688E ooobPLL  |ST 08 +8LLp ye°ZE 90°cl ON o4 }Ed anciD) ssaldAD|  Ni93g pag shemiy ]l
L6l oN al Py Hodysy aNz "ony pueybi ‘N|S
£6'0SPi6L  [00°0 cL govere |16 80'Gl ON al “Amid YUON | IONWYHD "8y pugUbiH "N|¢
££°GOL0L 000 oF 8ziC 80'GL 8Y'CL ON al 1S AURGT N[ IONVYHD "N PUBUBIH ‘NI
00'0SE61 000 08 062 [Ja&d! 611 ON al 1S JsaUD "3 IONYHD ETENEENE
OF"9ZL9E 000 98 9'L08E Pe'LlL [ ON ai 18 (A0 "S{IONVYHD "aky puelBIH ‘N|S
20680101 |EL¥LIZE  [PE £l 80058 e LL 19'6 ON o1 1S puog | SONYHD "aAY puelbi NS
£ /LEGE 0 98 969¢ 196 168 ON at "py 96pug SUEH] IONYHD EXEENENE
L9 8.66¢ 0 €L 969¢ 16'8 12'8 ON as ‘P #9A9"1 JR1SayD | JONVYHO "any puenBiy ‘NS
£5°ZL651 000 o8 8¥08Y ¥4} £l ON as EEEERENEEE “aAy pUBBIH ‘NG
(zvpA) eOry {zvpA) (Wwpw | (uhppw [ {wbuat| S apw  jlonuod adA) uonduasaqg uony aweN 13908 anoy
apqissnquiay | eany ueipa | uetpoiy | Aempeoy | Aempeoy | Bopug | Bo Bag |ssaday | dluoad Ampy Lpunog Buissoln
199USHIOA AJOJUBAU| 82BUNG ABMPEOY
522/2'201 $ (eospng Aempeoy) JuaWwasinquay WMUKEW PSIEMNOEY)
681801 (Zv0a) BRIY 928UNS ABMPEOY [E]0L
S0 ¢ |-puep auienbg 1ad Wwowasnquiey wnwxeiy parcddy

*MO[9q JUSISSINGHLISS WNUWIXBHUS PAFE[NOED YY) PIFOXAD
0} J0u ‘feAowWal Joptf pue Supmowt sutydew Supn|oxe ‘edourusjuleti J9a0s 10§ papuadxs Ajjen1oe Junowe St} Ul 10}0BIIU0Y) PlES 3SINGUILAL 01 $39158 S18IS UL "IPBIUOD S JO SULS)
3YJ Japun 10)0enu0D) 3Y) Aq paysnj} 10 dams ‘paurejuews £)oUnN01 3q [[LM YI1YM piek arenbs sjoym 1SAIEIL IY) 03 BAIE HBLINS KBMPEOI JUSLING Y] SIZIWAN J|ge ] Suimo]|o} 2y,

SHILFTVAIDINNW HONOYHL SAVMHOIH 41V.1S 40
AONVNIINIVIA SHL Y04 AUOLNIANI HOVAINS AVAIVOH

120T-L1-£0 "A9Y




V LIFIHXH

6p21801 :90ENG ABMpeoy |Bje ) 0£6'92 () ipBua [ejog

gl ON di "3q uojeny AE] 1S Je)saUD (861
Ov Z0sTL 0 ¥ ¥ 8EYS £9°1 90 ON g1 1QUBHOH | 3DNVHD 1S 1915940 (861
00 ¥9ZLE 0 ZE 891E 90 0 ON at 0LAMH]  NI938 1S 18ISy D 86 L

Zl ON at 1S 18ACYH N anN3 Aeniied UUON | 0Z
0089662 0 £9 veoy ZL Zi ON alL 1S [eqdwed IONYHO Aemyied UUON |02
00 29562 ] €9 Yeer FAT 0L ON at pd 9bpapny | IONVHD Aemyied YUON|0Z
0089152 808§ Gl 0% 8vere [v0l 26 ON EN P S0B[BM | IDNYHD Aemped {jION [0Z
00 +v.62 0 g9 Y8y P26 968 ON a.| AempedypoN]  LEHS 3] poomAioH |07
00 TLYEY 0 G9 Z6L09 |068 8L ON ai uoness seb gd|  Ni©3" "1} poomijjoH | 0Z
8 Jo € aned 1202-L1-€0 "A9Y




¥ LIdIHXd

90’65l  |(sa10€) Y JOENJUOD [BJOL .
PL¥E 9 69'S 0 69'S 9¥'Ll 86 oLls
OL'L¥ 9 Gg8'9 0 589 178l ?'al 211
8.S¥ 9 €9l 6e'E ¥y vEGL Ye'El vell
y0'8¢E 9 P£'9 0 P9 69¢l 90'¢i OLil

{saloe) |sawAn Bumop! (salioe) {sa1oe) eany (sai0r) paNy {Wpunia ] pug (w7) unuaa ) uibag adA | JaquinN
eany je10) | joJagqunN paNy |eJo] | SSo20y pajjonuon | uejpoi Aempeoy | a1noy
juawbag juawbasg

JPBRHUOD
199 S)JOM AlOJUSAU| Buimo iy

8Jo ¢ 3Beyq

02'261'2¢ :(Bumop) Wolussinguiioy WinWIXey palenden

00°S¥

§ 2loy Jad wawasinquiay Buimopy panosddy

“M0}3q Pajte1ap st akde Jod ao1ad sy pur $8)945 JO IoqUINT AU} Pad0Xa 0] J0U “TULMOU SUIYIBU IO} papuadxa Ajjenioe Junoum ay} ul JOBNU0D)
plEs ssInquilal 0f $32:5e QLIS YL "JORIUOD SIY] JO SULK UL IIPUR JOIIBIUOT} FYi AQ POUIBIUIBW G [[1M Y2TyM S2108 Ut 2aIe SuLmow 3|qiS1e oy saziumon o(qe], Sumofjoy sy,

HONVNALNIVIA ZHL Y04 DNIMOW SNIHOVIN 3718101718 40 AJOLNIAN]

SHILITVIIOINMAN HONOYHL SAVAHDIH 31V.1S JO

120C-L1-€0 A9y




v LIgIHX3

8J0 § 98eq

00289'$ (POCLL (') JolI] J0BIUOY [ej0L
00968 <66} [43 0005 § |99°L L 95°L Syl 086 o1 g
00°9021 L ve 4} 0005 $ 10T 1 102 L8l or'9i DL}
00°0¢s¢ or'0s Zl 000s 8¢ £ oF'L PESlL P6°€1L \4l
00°096 02’6l Zl 000S $ 91 L 09°L B89°€1L 202k _ ol
(s (‘i) sopphn [sW sen| (1w wawbag | (rw) pbuay (W} wuns) burpuz () rnuna) bulsuibag adAy | JequinnN
PpEoel | Jenn ap o |4ad soud | depn Jag SajlN juawbag Aempecy | amnoy
wawbag B0l Jagquunpy 1013 ssed Jay]
Pepuo) | wauwbag uswbag
pejuoY
J9aysSHIop Atojuaad)] Jo)rg
00'289's  $ |:(+anr) wawaesinquisy wnwixew palenied
00°0S % BN Jod ewasinguiey 19N panoiddy

“MO[3q PR{IEIap S o[Itu Jeal] Jad aa1ad syl puk $3[040 JO JSqUNU A1) PISIXA 01 J0U “|BAOWIRI JoN]] 10§ papuadia Ajjenioe JUNOLIE SY) Uf JOIDBHUCY) PIES ISINQUIAL
01 52215 911G 9], "JOLLIUOD SUY JO SULIS) JU3 JSPUR JODENRUOY) SY) AQ PAUIEIUIBIY 3q [[IM USIYM SI[IWL JEUY Ul [BAOLISL JARL JO [ISus 21qi31js oY) $oZ1WoN a[qe ), Sulmo}jo) su |

SALLITVAIDINAA HONOYHL SAVMHDIH 3LV.LS 0
HONVNALNIVIN dHL 304 "TYAOWZY ¥31L1T 371410179 40 AMOLNIANI

120T-L1-20 "AY




Rev. 03-17-2021

EXHIBIT A

Page 6 of 8
CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS

ROADWAY
ELIGIBLE FOR RE IMBURSEMENTS

Paved Surface Paved Surface

FIGURE 1A
[ 1\

1
NOM-ACCESS CONTROLLED
UNDIVIDED ROADWAY

ROADRAY
ELIGIBLE FOR REIMBURSEMENTS
Poved Surface Pavad Surfoce
s FIGURE 1B
- NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED T

UNDIVIDED ROADWAY

ROADWAY
ELIGIBLE FOR RETMBURSEMENTS

Snoulder]  Paved Surfoce Pavad Surfoce  |Shoulder
| l FIGURE IC
\\/ NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED ‘X
UNDIVIDED ROADWAY
WITHQUT CURB
NOTE: IN FIGURES 1A, 18, AND 1C FOR NON-CONTROLLED ROUTES
THE PAVED SURFACE WILL INCLUDE PAVED SHOULDERS.
ROADHAY
ELIGIBLE FOR REIMAURSEMENTS
Foved Surface Paved Surfoce
FIGURE D

o 5

NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED
UNDIVIDED ROADWAY
WITH CURB

ROADHAY
ELIGIBLE FOR REIMAURSEMENTS

Paved Surfuce N Povad Surface

=

Lo vy omwg LD iter

Rel e serent FIGURE 1E

' Arga Ellgible for

NON-ACCESS CONTROLLED
DIVIDED ROADWAY
WITH CURB



Page 7 of 8

Rev. 03-17-2021

CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS

91 FWNJIA

41 3™NII4

“S¥3I0NOAS G3AYd FONTIONI 114 IDVIHNS 03AVd 3HL
SILO0M 037704INOD SS33IV-NON HOJ 01 ONY J1 S3¥ndij Jl

2UNY INOHLIM AVAQYOY Q30IAI0
Q371108LNOT SS3JIIV-NON

N

*310N

SUGLD S QU [ B
E YRy T-N-Y. ]
204 64Q)B113 Doy

P03 IG5 DBADG

NYIO3M H1Q1& 35YIdvA

5035 PoADg

SINIAISHNBRIIY 804 37810173
AVAIVON

EHN] HLIMA AvMQVOd O3QIAIQ
037708LNOD SSIIDY-NON

J04417 PUD Buison
S04 @(qiBi13 paly

800}NG PRADY n_.ilm.ﬁ “gHS "
NYIOIH H1O018 3I8vIEVA

OI0LINS PRADG

SLNIHISUNGNR] 39 Bo4 31810113
Lyuavau

EXHIBIT A




Page 8 of 8

Rev. 03-17-2021

CITY MAINTENANCE
ROADWAY TYPICAL SECTIONS

gz 3ENal4
G30{A[GNN
SS330% 037108LNOD Kt/
LIALT .\.l\.\ LINIA
AVE-J0-1HITY 5 AYR-30-LH3Y
¥ / \ 40
avoy Yoy
FIYINOY ( | 39VANOHA
80 LT BODSING PAADY T RnnLINg POAD 0304 476 PBADG T D naus 7]
33N3d JINI
$€330Y S$5300v
Q3IT08IN0D G3TI0MENDD
SiW3AISHNEAL 3 HO4 391013
AVROYOR
¥Z Junalid
NYIQ3W HLIR
SS3IIV GITTIONINGD
LTHLT
AVR-40-1HOTY 1iA17
%0 _ _ u | AVH- 4D- £HOTY
avos RPINCUS  GODEINE DaADg | S W5 A GID NG DOADY 4B TGS | ¥
JOVENOU S NYTO3A NIGEs FIBVINYA avos
¥0 30V LHCYS
2% -
ENLEN
G317044N0D $9399%
AIVIOMINDD

SLNINISUNBNL 3N 804 37819173
AVROYOY

EXHIBIT A




May 12, 2021

The Honorable Scott Conger
Mayor, City of Jackson

P. O. Box 2508

Jackson, Tennessee 38302-2508

Dear Mayor Conger:

According to our records, Dr. Logan Hampton’s term as a member of the JEA Board of Directors
will expire on June 30, 2021. Dr. Hampton was initially appointed to this board for a five-year
term in May of 2017.

If you would like to contact Dr. Hampton directly, his cell number is (731) 234-3526. Once you
make the appointment for this position, we would appreciate receiving notification so

arrangements can be made for the public official’s security bond.

Sincerely,

'

(

“Yim Fexrell
JEF/ab

cc: Ms. Amy Mallette
Mr. Alex Reed



est Tennessee

™4 620 Skyline Drive
= H E A LT H C A R E T Jackson, Tennessee 38301
—_— P: 731.541.5000

January 5, 2021

Scott Conger

Mayor, City of Jackson
101 E. Main St.

Suite 302

Jackson, TN 38301

Dear Mayor Conger:

On behalf of West Tennessee Healthcare, | am asking for the reappointment of Phil Bryant to our Board
of Trustees, whose term ends in April 2021. Phil has been a valuable asset to our Board since he joined
in 2007 and has shown true leadership at West Tennessee Healthcare. He has served the board in
several capacities and currently is the Vice-Chair.

Phil is very accessible and always willing to assist or work extra when completing a project. He works
well with all Board Members and our Executive Leadership team. During this year, our Board of
Trustees has faced many challenges with the COVID-19 pandemic, which they haven’t faced before,
having to make decisions to support our health care system. Phil has been more than supportive of the
measures we have taken to keep our hospital staff and community safe.

| am respectfully requesting that the Jackson City Council reappoint him to our Board effective April 1,
2021.

| appreciate and thank you for all you do for West Tennessee Healthcare.

Sincerely,

it s

James E. Ross, MSHA, BSN, AEMT
President & CEO

JER/cm




Page 1 of 2

Sandy Maxwell - Fwd: Boards and Commissions Application 2021-02-25 03:44 PM(CST) Submission

Notification

—

=}

From: Amy Mallette
To: Sandy Maxwell
Date: 2/25/2021 4:00 PM

Subject: Fwd: Boards and Commissions Application 2021-02-25 03:44 PM(CST) Submission Notification

—

Here is another one!

Amy Mallette

City of Jackson | Executive Assista
121 E. Main Street, Suite 301
Jackson, TN 38301

(731)425-8240

nt

>»> <notification@jacksontn.gov> 2/25/2021 3:44 PM >>>
Boards and Commissions Application 2021-02-25 03:44 PM(CST) was submitted by Guest on
2/25/2021 4:44:34 PM (GMT-06:00) US/Central

Name Value
Name|Rachel Guyer
address|134 Terrace Place Jackson, TN 38301
phone|904-868-2165
email|rar.guyer@gmail.com

length-of-residency

4.5 years

application-type

new applicant

boards-and-commissions|]

city tree board jackson madison recreation and parks keep jackson beautiful

explain-interest

As a homeowner and citizen of Jackson, | have a vested interest in
improving the wellbeing of our city and, by extension, its residents. | have
been a resident of LANA (Lambuth Area Neighborhood Association) since |
moved to Jackson in 2016, and have witnessed the increasing improvements
to our neighborhood by both the residents and the City. | also see areas of
improvement to which | want to contribute.

1st-choice-name

Keep Jackson Beautiful Commission

1st Choice Position Seeking

Board of Directors Member

state your interest1

My professional experience in Agricultural Extension with the University of
Tennessee combined with my personal gardening hobby could be directly
applied to the Commission’s responsibilities of beautifying and promoting
interest in public places. | am especially invested in food security of
vulnerable members of our community. To this end, | have served as a
coordinator of St. Luke's Episcopal Church’s involvement in Room in the Inn
since 2018, a program operated by Area Relief Ministries in downtown

File- /110 Teerae/maxwells/ AnnData/Tocal/Temp/XParpwise/6037C98FCOJ DomCOJ PO... 2/25/2021



Page 2 of 2

Jackson that provides food and housing for homeless men. As a Keep
Jackson Beautiful board member, my primary goal would consist of
pursuing projects that not only improve aesthetic appeal, but promote
public health including food security and fitness. Examples of this are
community gardens, edible landscaping, and public green spaces. | would
be honored to contribute my time and talent to the KJB Commission.

2nd-choice|City Tree Board

2nd choice position

state your interest 2

3rd-choice-|Jackson Recreation and Parks Advisory Board

3rd choice position seeking

state your interest 3

any-other-qualifications
To view this form submission online, please follow the link below:
https://iacksontn.gov/form/one.aspx?objectld=17461261 &contextld=17024277&returnto=submissions
[NOTICE: This message originated outside of the City of Jackson mail system. -- DO NOT CLICK on

links, open attachments or provide any personal information unless you trust the sender and know
that the content is safe.]

F?lp-/'.’/(‘-ﬂT::m-c/mnvurp”Q/Ahnr)ﬂtﬂ”.n(‘,ﬁﬂ/TPmthPGThWiRE/ﬁOT?’CQRFCOJ DomCOJ PO... 2/25/2021



Page 1 of 1

Rena Tyler - Please print
e i _

From: JD Sims

To: Tyler, Rena

Date: 4/27/2021 10:39 AM
Subject: Please print

Superintendent of Groundskeeping
75A Wisteria St
Jackson, TN38301

Name Value
Name Jenni Deming
address 838 Campbell Street
phone 6
email jenni.deming(@gmail.com
length-of-residency 4 years
application-type new applicant
boards-and-commissions|] airport authority

I want everyone to have equal access to beautiful plants and beautiful

explain-interest spaces in Jackson.
1st-choice-name Keep Jackson Beautiful

I've done volunteer work with JD Sims (who suggested I apply for KJB)
and Celeste Scott, helping to advertise and disperse free trees for the
state your interestl community. I also organized the garden project and donations for
Andrew Jackson Elementary School. And I serve on the Horticultural
Advisory Council for Madison County.
2nd-choice n/a
state your interest 2 n/a
3rd-choice- n/a
state your interest 3 n/a
any-other-qualifications n/a
To view this form submission online, please follow the link below:

: ‘
Superintendent of Groundskeeping

75A Wisteria St
Jackson, TN38301

file:///C:/Users/tylerr/AppData/Local/Temp/XPgrpwise/6087E9E2COJ_DomCOJ_PO1001... 4/27/2021



Page 1 of 1

Sandy Maxwell - Boards and Commissions Application 2021-03-19 08:34 PM(CST) Submission
Notification

— 5 P x — za ey S i, S S SN

From: <notification@)jacksontn.gov>

To: <smaxwell@cityofjackson.net>

Date: 3/19/2021 8:29 PM

Subject: Boards and Commissions Application 2021-03-19 08:34 PM(CST) Submission Notification

Boards and Commissions Application 2021-03-19 08:34 PM(CST) was submitted by Guest on
3/19/2021 9:34:03 PM (GMT-06:00) US/Central

{ Name Value
Name|Abensiba Misiedjan " pn 3"
address|320 Stewart Rd
phone| 14237718911
email|amisiedjan@usfca.edu

length-of-residency|15 Months

application-type new applicant

boards-and-commissions|[]|keep jackson beautiful

[ have a passion for the environment and people, I recently started a non
profit organization that focuses on educating the youth in urban
communities on the significance of growing your own food. Jackson has
been growing and I would and I believe that in a few year it will and can be
as big as Nashville with as long as we have like minded individuals like
myself that appreciate the history that Jackson has to offer.

explain-interest

E 1st-choice-name|Keep Jackson Beautiful
1st Choice Position Seeking|Member

I'm currently attending the University of San Francisco and I'm majoring in
state your interestl|Business Management and minoring in Urban Agriculture and [ would like
to use my knowledge to contribute to improving Jackson.

2nd-choice|N/A
2nd choice position

state your interest 2
3rd-choice-|N/A
3rd choice position seeking

state your interest 3

any-other-qualifications|Agriculture, culinary, management.

To view this form submission online, please follow the link below:

https://jacksontn.gov/form/one.aspx?objectld=17527017&contextld=17024277&returnto=submissions

[NOTICE: This message originated outside of the City of Jackson mail system. -- DO NOT CLICK on links, opt
attachments or provide any personal information unless you trust the sender and know that the content is saf

file:///C:/Users/maxwells/AnnData/l .ocal/Temn/XPornwice/605500C4COT DamCOT PO 2/77/7071



City of Jackson
Budget Amendments $10,000 or Less Approved by the Mayor
June 1, 2021

insurance Recovery - £EDP Equipment $1,250.00
insurance Recovery — JPD $2,948.35
insurance Recovery - JPD $5,700.00




Oﬂ.m - ._km
.omﬂ&nm St SN A)

(2 - <o)

(adc ~ 20)

miuo ]
~my oS - Gl i

3

L6 LTL LLY dav

LETLELLLT pec
L6 LZLLLT T6B£0d-10" LOSLZHOOUA 1202/0E/%
00°01Z°8Z

00°0TZ'8E ¥

00°0TZ’'BZ ae

00°0TZ'BZ X3
00"0TZ BT N¥IATELS 0STIRIXIMEOI TZ0Z/0E/¥%
00°006 0T

00°000°0T w

00°000°'0T a¥

00°000°'0T b
00°000°0T TZ0Z/0E/%
52 965 °8€

SZ"965°8E w

SZ"965°8€ ay

SZ°965°8E pct
€Z"965°HE CO-A¥AS LINSNOD J0¥d 1Z02Z/%1/S
00°0LZ TE

D0 0LEZ "TE w

00" 0LZIE av

00°0LEZ ‘1€ b
00-0LZ‘TE 6T6STTHIOY TZ0Z/0E/¥
00°098°%2

00°099'%2 w

00°089'%2 av

00°00E‘Z X3

00°09€'2e Xq
00" 099°'%¥2 adar-SNI NOIIVIAY T2O0T/0E/®
057196 'CT

€0°TES'T w

LY 9E¥ 1T w

€0°TES'T ayv

LY 9EP 1T av

6T TEE‘TT X=

€0°TES'T X3

82°S0T b
05-L96°Z1 LELEEBEETLAZ S IDOY TZOZ/OEST
Jury SOTOAUT ====-voT3dTIo83Q---- TBW 2380 MUD

0TsvaY PI
T :3bea

TZITEZ-STIE
ZE6-06TEP-STE

D-59E2ST TZ0Z/CL/Y

ETZLT-0TT
TZTTZ-STE
006-D8TZP-STE

D-0SEZST 1z0Z/0E/E

ETETT-0TT
ITTIZ-0TT
0ZL-006TV-0TT

D-9¥ETST 1202/22/¢€

ETZTT-01T
IZTIZ-01T
0SZ-DO0ETP-0TT

J-SE€9TST TZOZ/OE/¥

ETZTTI-0TT
TZTTZ-STE
006-¥SCTT-STE

D-£2ETST 1202/1E/€

ETZTI-0TT
TZITZ-0TT
ETIS-006T¥-0TT
&TS-006T%-0TT

2-1TEEST TZ0Z/L2/%

ETETT-0TT

ETTLT-0TI

TZTIZ-2%T

IZITZ-OTIT

S¥Z-0STZF-0TT

SPZ-6ZTTP-CVI

SYT-0IETP-0TT
D=66ECST TZ0Z/1T/E
UnN RS IqunN Od 83e(g AUT

330day AXO3ISTH IDTOAUT
NOSADNL 20 ALID

SLOZSLO HLIWS WYHSTND ZS58EZ
#»xSTIULOL HOANTAxxx
£ZTETT ONI XIHAWMD SOOIDONHEL S6TOE

*xx3TULOL YOANIAxxr

TZ0Z/ZT/€0 NI THYD-E0TD TONVHOXE LIVEZ

»3»STYLOL HOONHAx»»

LS9ESTTOO T4 WAId Y1 3SNOHD STS0E

#xxSTYLOL HOONTAx»x

TO*¥980200£05 I SIADIANIS UIMOd DRAVTID 9¥STT

»xxSTLIOL UOONAAxx»

65S8T NOWD IONWHNSNI NVNVHING 9£082

> STELOL HOTONEAxx =

E0X.L6L66BERELBE ALITIEOW L3IV LBPOE
S - -®OTOAUL==== =wv=-==v-=BUEN=~=======- TSQUNN

DOLSIIHM I8
05:0T !BUWTL
1Z0Z/0Z/S :@3=Q




BZ BZI'8T

B6E‘LOE'LT

6E LOE"LT

TL T99'%1

TL-TS9'FT

LE'T98®'ZL

LE"TSB'EZL

0T ¥5B°68T

0T ¥58 ‘68T

02 T16°89

0L LEG'0¥

05 ELE'LE

¥8°LOS'6EE

LB 6LL'TST

quy DOTOAUT

0T2¥dY ‘PI
z :abeg

82°829°8T pec DEETE-OTT
XIN-934 403 1408 ¥4y TZ0Z/0E/% O-TTFZST 1202/02/%
6ELOE'LT w ETZTT-0TT
6ELOE’LT a9 TZTIZ-0TT
6E°LOE LT bt TIT#T-0TT
FOYEYD-SWD TE0Z/%1/S J-68925T TZ0E/%0/S
TLT39'PT o €IZTT-0TT
TL T99'¥T av TZTTZ-0TT
TL"T99 BT b <t 008-50LTH#-0TT
ANZ-SSENEWITY LNVHED TZ0Z/0E/¥ D-98E€ZST tz0z/62/%
LETTIB'ZL w0 ETZTT-01T
LE'T9B 2L av TZTEZ-01T
LETI8'2L pacs LSL-006T%-0TT
NTED INTWIIANIFE aNT 120Z/0E/¥% J-Z8€EST T20Z/6T/%
01" %58 "68T w €TZTT-0TT
0T %58 68T a9 IZITZ-STIE
0T %SB'6BT X2 0O06-08TZ¥-STE
TZ0Z/0E/% D-LLEEST T202/0€/€
0L LEG 0¥ w ETZTI-0TT
0L LEE 0¥ av TZTTZ~SIE
OL LEG'O¥ X3 006-08TZH-5TE
H ONTINOOW/SHILOAWOD TZ0Z/%T/S J-LL9TST T20Z/12/%
05" €LE"LE o E€TZTI-0TT
0S5 ELE'LE ay 1ZTITZ-0TT
05 €L6°LE b i< §SZ-0TZZF-0TT
-SYILOAWOD NOOEHONOL Tz0Z/%T/S O-LLITST TZ0Z/L1/%
L8°6LL'TST w €TZTT-0TT
LB 6LL'TOT a¥ TZTTZ-S1E
LB 6LL'TIST b o< ZEE-06TEP-STE
IX3 OS dX€ 5% S 0*EY 1z0Z/%1/s D-0L3ZST T20Z/80/S
L6 LZLLLT w £IZTI-0TT
-----uoT3dTI083d---~ UeW 23'd MUIJ wny 3O9y) IaqunN Od S3ed AUT

330d3y AI03ASTH IDT0AUT
NOSMO¥L 30 ALID

T80EE FALSOHUL 00 NOSIAUW

»xxSTULOL FOANTA»xx

9ZISYEANI~Sd ANYIWOD TIO OWEWIX

*xxSTILOL AKINTAx = x

£80€E IYORLOY IISNVAL NMOSAINVL

2»»STILOL HOONEAr»»

TZOZOMUT YIEWYHD NOSAIYL
»xxSTELOL HOONIAxxrx»
TZE6 1T CEETIDELNIT

»xxSTYLOL JOANTAxx»

ET68Z800TT I YOLDIS OITENA LHOISNI

EPLLZEBO0TE T JOLOES DITHNG LHOISHI

»»»STILOL YHOONTAxx»

TTEESLO HLIWS WYHSTED

----3DTOAUL---~ --=-=== -~ = ~QUWeN--=======~

SPZI

?9%0€

ovse

ZZ8e9

S68LZ

££6S2

£E6SE

ZS8EZ

JOLSLIHM *I981

0S:0T

TZ0T/02/S

SBWTL
:33vq



huw« wo) - 9 )

(30 ¥

-

.;\4(.60 *.s\matv

TE 0ST'LT

8€°9%Z2 8T

£E£°888 9T

EE"888791

DE"TZS'PE

GE"TZY'¥E

00°ZBT'6T

00°ZBL 6T

92" 6BE‘S0E

LS TZTL'062

69°£99°ST

PE LIV '6E

90°6£8'0Z

JWY IDTOAUT

0T9%d¥ :PI
€ :abegq

T6°0ST LT av

T6°0ST LT X5
FITAYD-5YD 1202 /0E/%
8E€"9%Z ‘BT w
BE"9FZ'BT av
8E 92 8T pcd
FOVEYD-SYD TZ0Z/0€/%
EE"BE8'9T w
€E°RE88°9T av
££°888°91 bect
0EE0BO0HLISAD T20Z/0E/%
0E"TZ9'FE w
0E° 129’ FE av
DE"TZ9’¥E pc
£69B#04-L965SZS000T TZOZ/0E/V
0D"Z8T 6T w
00°Z8T 6T av
00°ZBT'6T XE
ALID-SHIVATY TIYMANC TZOT/¥T/S
LS TZL'06Z w
L5 TZL 06T x4
LS TZL' 062 p.ac
STH-ONIJHNA TIIJONTT TZ0Z/?T/S
69°L99 5T w
69°L99%°ST a4
69°£L93°ST pct
STH-ONTAWAT ‘TITIAONYY T20Z/%1/S
90°6€8°02 w
90°6€£8 02 ay¥
30°6E8°02 b <cs
XIW-N¥D 304 Ldod ¥ TZOZ/0E/ Y
8z B8Z3'8T w
8Z°BZS 'S8T d¥
..... uor1dTIDEdd-~-~-~ UEW S3IBd NUD

IZTITZ-011
TITFI-0TT
2-ESFEST 1zDZ/T0/%

€IZTIT-0TT
1ZTIZ-01T
TITPT-0TT
D-ES¥ZST 1Z0Z/€2/%

£IZTI-0TL
TZITZ-0TT
TTI#T-0TT
D-SERZST 1202/%1/%

£TZTI-0TT

12TTZ-0TT

ZSZ-009ZF-0TT

D-9Z%2ST Z0z/to/v

ETETT-0TT

TZTITT-STIE

006-TTBTIF=-STE

O-ZTLEST TZOZ/TZ/¥%

ETETT-0TT

TZTITZ-1TET

ZTYZ-0ETEY-TET

J-POLZST iz0Z/T0/S

€IZTT-0TT

TZTTZ-TET

96Z-0EZEH-TET

D-%0LZST TZ0Z/0E/¥

EIZTIT-0TL
TZTITIZ-0TT
OE6TE-OTT
J-TT¥2ST T20Z/0Z/%
€IZTI-0OTT
TZTTIZ-0TY
uny }ISD IFGqUNN Od  I1ed AUL

3zodey AIOASTH 90TOAUT
NOSMOWL J0 ALID

S0¥98 ONI NOSHID-SIAHE0X TB6LT

aeo®L ONI NOSHID-SIMIE0d T86LZ

»xxSTLLOL HOANTAvrv

NT-$ITTS60 DTI dO00¥D AONENIT NYWSYE ZS662

wxnSTYIOL FOANTAv v ¥

EQOEBTEQEZS ONI SNOILOTOS WIOHOLOW Z8LLEZ

*#xSTULOL HOUONTAx»x»

ZOLT SNOD SSANISNE HINOS-OIN TTI09E

» %2 STULOL HOONZAx»x

Tz-xdv¢ WAOTIAZA AILNNOD NOSIOYW EZTZHT

LZOBE00000 WIOTIAEA ALNNOD NOSIOYW £ZZ¥CT

*x»5TULOL HOONTA»xx

ZBOEE FILSOUL OO NOSIGYW SPZT

- === @OTOAUL - === =-=m==em= BRI - S —— Taquny

OOLSITHM :I38n
05:07 :swrg
1z0z/0Z/S :93EQ



m.hou - STV wx\uu

IT°925"Z0T

16°6ET°952

PE 089°CT

£5°021 822

62 E0LTT

6Z°E0L'TT

00°000°'6T

00°000°ST

0E %08’ 1T

S LEE’TT

99°9T% 0T

D0 ET¥ 05

IL°SI0’ST

Juny 30T0AUTL

019%d¥ :PI
3 1abeg

S¥H-S0a¥/JI0TION 1Z0Z/%1/S D-G6LTST 1zoz/T0/S
16°6E€1'95% w ETZTIT-O0TT
16°6ET'9SZ av TETTZ-TET
16°6E£T1°95Z X3 86Z-0EZEF-TET

SSH-Srav/nd HHMeD TZ0Z/%T/S J-S6LZST 1Z02/1T0/5
¥%-089°CT w ETZTT-0TT
% 089 °ZT av TZTTZ-TET
By 089°ZT b ez EPZ-0EZEP-TET

STH-SHANTYINGD JWIL 120Z/%T/S D-¥6LZST TZ0Z/E0/S
€5°02T'BEZ w ETZTT-0TT
£5°02T’'8Z2 ay TEITZ-1ET
€5-02ZT'8ZZ boc§ LEE-0EZET-TET

? 0d STA/ISOOT WWOD 120Z/%1/S D-S6LEST 120Z/10/5
6Z°EO0L'TT pn) ETZTT-0TT
6T EOL'TT av T2TIZ-0TT
gz E0L'IT X= LZTLZ-0TT

TOIA/SHEA/SANIS ISIH 120Z/%1/s 0-SBSZST T202/90/5
00°000°6T w £IZTT-0TT
00000 6T dav TETTEZ-STE
00°000°‘6T piict 006-CELFF-STE
SUAD-WAMOW WRINL O¥IZ T20Z/%T/S J-%9LEZST T202/22/%
79 LBE'TT o EIZTT-0TT
$9°LBE'TT dy TZITZ-0TT
$9°LBE'TT X3 0SZ-00ET¥-0TT
€0L00 T¥BOOOH#ETIII T20Z/0E/% D-¥9%ZST TZ0Z/TE/E
99°9T%'01 w0 ETZTT-0TT
99°9T%'0T av TZTTZ-0TT
997 9T%'0T X3 0SZ-00ETH-0TT
LOD-ANES TTYOST KTHIW TZOZ/¥T/S D-ESLZST TZ0Z/€0/S
TL°STO'ST w0 €IZTT-0TT
TL*STO’ST da¥ TZITZ-0TT
TL'STO’ST pict ZITHT-0TT
FITEYD-TISILA T202/%T/S D-9%L2ST T20Z/€0/S
T6°0ST LT w £TZTT-0TT
a—— |ﬂ0..nuﬂ..nkuwmﬂ| === U 3a3ed Ud WnyN Y230 Iaquny Od 23ed AUl

axodey A1035TH 20TOAUT
NOSMIOY( 40 XLID

OTZ0Z/T/S I

g1202/T/S I

6-89ZZ-58LSEEV I

\WTZ/T10/50 I

SIDOIAYES HLVEO0JE0D WM ZISOE

SIDIAYES FINIOJUOD WM ZISOE

STOTANIS EILVHOJACD WM ZISOE

SADIANES ALTIOGH0D WM ZTIS0E

#xxSTYLOL HOONIA»x»

0TTIZZ ALIIYS JO INIWIHYIIA NI Z92OT

YLOTGELO

*»2xSTYLOL JOANTAx»»

OTT ¥0IDWYL FISSINNEL TELLT

>3 xSTELOL VOANINxxx

DT Z6Z86 €401 2 JIIFNJYH SNIDYNMAS LOEL

1Z/¥1/S0-896LC €HOD ¥ IIANMVE SNIOWSAS LOEL

ES8%8

----2DTOAUL---- --

»+2 STYLOL MOONEN«¥+

ONI NOSHID-SIMIH0E T86LT

DJOLSLIHM -I38Q
0S:0T 2wl
1zoz/0z/s :93eg



LETERLILIE’T *x ¥ THEQL ONVHDxsxa

66" 99F 668 » >3 STHIOL HOONHAx»»
TL 9257201 X3 ETZTT-0ET
TT 925’201 v IZTTZ-TET
IT 925°¢0T pC) B56E~0TZEEF-TET
WY BOTOAUT 00 —---- coT3dTI08ag---- UeH 9380 WD NN YO8YD IOGUNK Od  SIBd AUI - -BOTOAUL--=- —===cm=-- LT R TacuITyy

DOLSIEHM :IDS0
QTSFAY PT 1zoday AXOISTH 3STOAUL 65:0T WL

5 tabeq NOSXOYL 40 ALTD gog/og/s  EIRg



