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Rita Cosby
Rita Cosby brings her unmatched
journalistic pedigree and powerful
presence to the national airwaves
every weeknight from 10PM to 12AM
ET on Red Apple Audio Networks. A
legendary broadcaster and Emmy-
winning journalist, Rita has interviewed
some of the biggest names in politics,
world affairs, and entertainment.

Renowned for her exclusive reporting
and compassionate approach, Rita has
earned a reputation as one of the most
trusted and compelling voices in talk
radio.

As host of The Rita Cosby Show on
77WABC Radio, she offers gripping
analysis, must-hear interviews, and
real-time reaction to the most
important stories of the day.

From breaking news and political
showdowns to human interest stories
that inspire, Rita Cosby delivers
impactful, thought-provoking content
that captivates and informs late-night
listeners across America.


