
COUNTY OF BARRY
QUESTION

YES

NO

Shall the County of Barry continue to
levy the one-half (1/2) cent county wide
sales tax for a period of five (5) years,
for the purpose of capital improvements
to county roads and bridges.

BARRY COUNTY HEALTH
DEPARTMENT

FOUR YEAR TERM
MEMBER
FOR BOARD OF TRUSTEES

Vote for THREE

JAMES BRASEL

DAVID SATER

ROGER SCHNACKENBERG

PAUL STRAHL

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

AURORA R-VIII SCHOOL
DISTRICT
Proposition 1
To choose by ballot two directors who
shall serve as members of the Board of
Education of said school district for a
term of three years each.

FOR DIRECTORS
THREE YEAR TERM
Vote for TWO

MARK McCULLY

JERAMIE GROSENBACHER

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

SAMPLE BALLOT
GENERAL MUNICIPAL ELECTION 

APRIL 6, 2021
BARRY COUNTY, MISSOURI

NOTICE OF ELECTION
Notice is hereby given that the General Municipal Election will be held in the County of Barry on Tuesday, April 6, 2021 as certified to 
this office by the participating entities of Barry County.  The ballot for the Election shall be in substantially the following form.

QUESTION

YES

NO

Shall the Aurora R-VIII School District of
Lawrence County, Missouri issue its
general obligation bonds in the amount
of $7,700,000, resulting in no estimated
increase to the debt service tax levy, for
the purpose of constructing, improving,
repairing, renovating, furnishing and
equipping school facilities, including:

• Secure entryways and safety
improvements at Robinson School
and Aurora Junior High School;

• Construction of severe weather,
storm hardened shelters; and

• Renovations and utility efficiency
upgrades to all District facilities?

If this question is approved, the District's
debt service tax levy is estimated to
remain unchanged at $1.05 per $100 of
assessed valuation of real and personal
property.

MONETT R-1 SCHOOL
DISTRICT
Proposition 1:  To choose by ballot
two (2) board members who shall serve
as members of the Board of Education of
said school district for a term of three (3)
years each.

FOR BOARD MEMBERS
THREE YEAR TERM
Vote for TWO

KALEY THIGPEN

KEN GASPAR

MAELLA BLALOCK

A. J. BAHL

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN



PIERCE CITY R-VI SCHOOL
DISTRICT
To elect, by ballot, two (2) directors, who
shall serve as members of the Board of
Education of said District for a term of
three (3) years.

FOR BOARD OF EDUCATION
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for TWO

DANIELLE SAFFER

NICHOLAS CUNNINGHAM

JACKIE DUANE TURNER

CHRISTOPHER MICHAEL
JASUMBACK

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

REEDS SPRING R-IV
SCHOOL DISTRICT
To choose by ballot two (2) directors
who shall serve as members of the
Board of Education of said School
District.

FOR DIRECTORS
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for TWO

JOELENE L. POWELL

LISA M. BOYD

RICHARD STALEY

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

SHELL KNOB NO. 78
SCHOOL DISTRICT
To choose by ballot two directors who
shall serve as members of the Board of
Education of said school district for a
term of (3) years each.

FOR DIRECTOR
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for TWO

CARLA HARTWELL

SANDRA S. CUPPS

DONNA R. LEHR

ROBERT "BOB" STEWART

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

PURDY R-II SCHOOL DISTRICT

To choose by ballot two (2) directors
who shall serve as members of the
Board of Education of said School
District.

FOR DIRECTORS
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for TWO

REUBEN WADE HENDERSON

KEN TERRY

KELLI STEPHENS

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

PROP RS

YES

NO

    Shall the Board of Education of
Reeds Spring R-IV School District be
authorized to increase the operating tax
levy by $0.55 per one hundred dollars of
assessed valuation in order to meet the
goals of the strategic plan, which
includes early childhood education and
college and career readiness
expansion, hiring additional employees
to expand opportunities, and increasing
compensation in order to attract and
retain quality faculty and staff?

    If this question is approved, the
District's operating tax levy is estimated
to increase from $3.0185 to $3.5685 per
one hundred dollars of assessed
valuation of real and personal property.

WHEATON R-III SCHOOL
DISTRICT
To choose by ballot two directors who
shall serve as members of the Board of
Education of said School District for a
term of three years each.

FOR DIRECTORS
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for TWO

CHRIS RAY

MEAGAN McCULLAH

KEVIN SCHLESSMAN

TIMOTHY PECKHAM

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN



NORTH STONE NORTHEAST
BARRY COUNTY FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT
FOR DIRECTOR
SIX YEAR TERM

Vote for TWO

ROBERT SAVAGE

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

WHEATON FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT
QUESTION

YES

NO

Shall the board of directors of Wheaton
Fire Protection District be authorized
levy an additional tax of not more than
30 cents on the one hundred dollar
assessed valuation to provide funds for
the support of the district?

VIOLA SPECIAL ROAD
DISTRICT

THREE YEAR TERM
FOR ROAD COMMISSIONER

Vote for ONE

WRITE-IN

CAPPS CREEK SPECIAL ROAD
DISTRICT
QUESTION

YES

NO

Shall the Capps Creek Special Road
District of Barry County, Missouri, levy
an additional tax rate of $0.19 per one
hundred dollar assessed valuation for a
period of four (4) years?

CITY OF CASSVILLE

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR MAYOR

Vote for ONE

BILL SHIVELEY

WRITE-IN

TWO YEAR TERM
ALDERMAN
FOR NORTH WARD

Vote for ONE

JON HORNER

WRITE-IN

BUTTERFIELD SPECIAL ROAD
DISTRICT
FOR ROAD COMMISSIONER
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

WRITE-IN

MINERAL SPECIAL ROAD
DISTRICT
FOR ROAD COMMISSIONER
THREE YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

RON STRICKLIN

QUENTIN BRADLEY

WRITE-IN

EXETER SPECIAL ROAD
DISTRICT
QUESTION

YES

NO

Shall the Exeter Special Road District of
Barry County, Missouri vote to retain the
$0.1347 cents additional levy per one
hundred dollar assessed valuation for a
period of four (4) years? The total
additional levy will be $0.1347 cents per
one hundred dollar assessed valuation.

CITY OF BUTTERFIELD
FOR ALDERMAN EAST WARD
Vote for ONE

MARK THOMAS

WRITE-IN

FOR ALDERMAN WEST WARD
Vote for ONE

DARRELL MATHIS

WRITE-IN

FOR SOUTH WARD
ALDERMAN
TWO YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

TAYLOR WEAVER

WRITE-IN



PROPOSITION

FOR SAID PROPOSITION

AGAINST PROPOSITON

Proposition to ratify and approve
Ordinance No. 1842 of the City of
Cassville, Missouri, granting to Barry
Electric Cooperative, Inc. (hereinafter
referred to as Barry Electric), its
subsidiaries, successors and assigns,
authority to: use the streets, alleys and
public grounds of the City of Cassville,
Missouri, for the purpose of erecting and
maintaining an electric distribution
system, a fiber optic broadband system
and other communication systems
together with the necessary poles,
wires, cables, apparatus, equipment
and appliances; to string wires and
cables above or below ground; and to
do all things necessary and proper for
the purpose of generating, procuring,
distributing and selling electric energy,
broadband communications and other
communication services; to distribute,
supply and sell electric energy,
broadband communications, internet,
telephone, cable television, video
streaming and other communication
services in the City of Cassville.
Authorizing Barry Electric to allow other
communication providers to attach wires
and cables to poles owned by Barry
Electric on such terms and conditions as
it may determine. The rights granted
under Ordinance No. 1842 to continue
for a period of thirty (30) years, all as
provided in said Ordinance.

TWO YEAR TERM
ALDERMAN
FOR SOUTH WARD

Vote for ONE

RHONDA SCOTT

WRITE-IN

CITY OF SELIGMAN

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR MAYOR

Vote for ONE

MICHAEL AVERS

WRITE-IN

CITY OF EXETER
FOR MAYOR
TWO YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

JEFF SCOTT

WRITE-IN

FOR NORTH WARD
ALDERMAN
TWO YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

CHRISTINE HAMMERS

WRITE-IN

PROPOSITION

FOR SAID PROPOSITION

AGAINST PROPOSITON

Proposition to ratify and approve
Ordinance No.12152020 of the City of
Exeter, Missouri, granting to Barry
Electric Cooperative, Inc. (hereinafter
referred to as Barry Electric), its
subsidiaries, successors and assigns,
authority to: use the streets, alleys and
public grounds of the City of Exeter,
Missouri, for the purpose of erecting and
maintaining an electric distribution
system, a fiber optic broadband system
and other communication systems
together with the necessary poles,
wires, cables, apparatus, equipment
and appliances; to string wires and
cables above or below ground; and to
do all things necessary and proper for
the purpose of generating, procuring,
distributing and selling electric energy,
broadband communications and other
communication services; to distribute,
supply and sell electric energy,
broadband communications, internet,
telephone, cable television, video
streaming and other communication
services in the City of Exeter.
Authorizing Barry Electric to allow other
communication providers to attach wires
and cables to poles owned by Barry
Electric on such terms and conditions as
it may determine. The rights granted
under Ordinance No. 12152020 to
continue for a period of thirty (30) years,
all as provided in said Ordinance.

FOR EAST WARD
ALDERMAN
TWO YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

RON CORN

WRITE-IN

FOR WEST WARD
ALDERMAN
TWO YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

ROBERT "BOB" HUGHES

WRITE-IN



PROPOSITION

YES

NO

Proposition to ratify and approve
Ordinance No. 20-23 of the City of
Seligman, Missouri, granting to Barry
Electric Cooperative, Inc. (hereinafter
referred to as Barry Electric), its
subsidiaries, successors and assigns,
authority to: use the streets, alleys and
public grounds of the City of Seligman,
Missouri, for the purpose of erecting and
maintaining an electric distribution
system, a fiber optic broadband system
and other communication systems
together with the necessary poles,
wires, cables, apparatus, equipment
and appliances; to string wires and
cables above or below ground; and to
do all things necessary and proper for
the purpose of generating, procuring,
distributing and selling electric energy,
broadband communications and other
communication services; to distribute,
supply and sell electric energy,
broadband communications, internet,
telephone, cable television, video
streaming and other communication
services in the City of Seligman.
Authorizing Barry Electric to allow other
communication providers to attach wires
and cables to poles owned by Barry
Electric on such terms and conditions as
it may determine. The rights granted
under Ordinance No. 20-23 to continue
for a period of thirty (30) years, all as
provided in said Ordinance.

CITY OF WASHBURN

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR MAYOR

Vote for ONE

JOHN TIEDEMAN

WRITE-IN

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR ALDERMAN AT LARGE

Vote for TWO

JEREMY JOHNSTON

THOMAS GALLOWAY

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

PROPOSITION

FOR SAID PROPOSITION

AGAINST PROPOSITON

Proposition to ratify and approve
Ordinance No. 2020-008 of the City of
Washburn, Missouri, granting to Barry
Electric Cooperative, Inc. (hereinafter
referred to as Barry Electric), its
subsidiaries, successors and assigns,
authority to: use the streets, alleys and
public grounds of the City of Washburn,
Missouri, for the purpose of erecting and
maintaining an electric distribution
system, a fiber optic broadband system
and other communication systems
together with the necessary poles,
wires, cables, apparatus, equipment
and appliances; to string wires and
cables above or below ground; and to
do all things necessary and proper for
the purpose of generating, procuring,
distributing and selling electric energy,
broadband communications and other
communication services; to distribute,
supply and sell electric energy,
broadband communications, internet,
telephone, cable television, video
streaming and other communication
services in the City of Washburn.
Authorizing Barry Electric to allow other
communication providers to attach wires
and cables to poles owned by Barry
Electric on such terms and conditions as
it may determine. The rights granted
under Ordinance No. 2020-008 to
continue for a period of thirty (30) years,
all as provided in said Ordinance.

CITY OF WHEATON
FOR MAYOR
TWO YEAR TERM

Vote for ONE

DAVID SHOCKLEY

WRITE-IN

FOR EAST WARD
ALDERMAN

Vote for ONE

CASEY PREWITT

WRITE-IN

FOR WEST WARD
ALDERMAN

Vote for ONE

JON BRATTIN

WRITE-IN



PROPOSITION

FOR SAID PROPOSITION

AGAINST PROPOSITON

Proposition to ratify and approve
Ordinance No. 12720 of the City of
Wheaton, Missouri, granting to Barry
Electric Cooperative, Inc. (hereinafter
referred to as Barry Electric), its
subsidiaries, successors and assigns,
authority to: use the streets, alleys and
public grounds of the City of Wheaton,
Missouri, for the purpose of erecting and
maintaining an electric distribution
system, a fiber optic broadband system
and other communication systems
together with the necessary poles,
wires, cables, apparatus, equipment
and appliances; to string wires and
cables above or below ground; and to
do all things necessary and proper for
the purpose of generating, procuring,
distributing and selling electric energy,
broadband communications and other
communication services; to distribute,
supply and sell electric energy,
broadband communications, internet,
telephone, cable television, video
streaming and other communication
services in the City of Wheaton.
Authorizing Barry Electric to allow other
communication providers to attach wires
and cables to poles owned by Barry
Electric on such terms and conditions as
it may determine. The rights granted
under Ordinance No. 12720 to continue
for a period of thirty (30) years, all as
provided in said Ordinance.

ARROW POINT VILLAGE

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR TRUSTEE

Vote for TWO

KAYLEEN LENTZ

KENDALL P. HANSON

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

CHAIN O LAKES
VILLAGE NO. 2

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR TRUSTEE

Vote for THREE

BRENDA PIERCE

MIKE STROTHER

BARBARA WOLFE

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

VILLAGE OF EMERALD BEACH

TWO YEAR TERM
FOR TRUSTEE

Vote for THREE

MATTHEW McBRYDE

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

WRITE-IN

PROPOSITION ONE

YES

NO

SHALL THE VILLAGE OF EMERALD
BEACH, INC. MISSOURI BE
ALLOWED TO INCREASE GENERAL
MAINTENANCE ON HOMEOWNERS
ONLY FROM $100 TO $150
BEGINNING JANUARY 1, 2022?

PROPOSITION TWO

YES

NO

SHALL THE VILLAGE OF EMERALD
BEACH, INC. BE AUTHORIZED TO
FORGO ANNUAL ELECTIONS IF THE
NUMBER OF CANDIDATES WHO
HAVE FILED FOR A PARTICULAR
OFFICE IS EQUAL TO THE NUMBER
OF POSITIONS IN THE OFFICE TO BE
FILLED BY THE ELECTION?




